Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 25 August 2022 12:07 PM
To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: JTE 4504 FINALISE

From: June Yap <motorstopoffice@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 25 August 2022 12:06:28 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: JTE 4504 FINALISE

Okay, We accept the amount of $3550.
When can we send the LOD?

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall not
prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal
injuries.*

Cheers,
Yap June
Motor Stop Services Pte Ltd

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #01-07
Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 415875
Telephone: 6385-1838
Fax : 6386-1838

On Wed, Aug 24, 2022 at 10:56 PM Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi,

Please refer attached, COR I/s $3550, 5 days.

Subject to insurance approval.

Regards

Taufikh



Lkk Auto



