Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 22 August 2022 6:35 PM

To: SUR

Cc: jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg; Carrine Leong; Claims; '‘Boo seng yak'

Subject: FINAL REVISION - SNA932P - TP ALLIANZ - SURVEYED 19 MAR 22

Attachments: PA02952022 - SNA 932 P - AUDI A3 SB 1.5 TFSI - REAR - ALLIANZ (TP).xIsx; SNA 932

main estimate1.pdf

| have done the checking. Please assist.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Boo seng yak <boojohnny@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 22 August 2022 3:11 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg <jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg>; Carrine Leong
<carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg>; Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: Re: FINAL REVISION - SNA932P - TP ALLIANZ - SURVEYED 19 MAR 22

Hi Steve and all,
Attached, please find amended revised estimate.
Please confirm repair cost of $16,700.30 @ 9 days exclude 1 Sunday & 1 PH.

Your early closure is appreciated.

Best regards - Johnny Boo

On Sun, Aug 21, 2022 at 1:39 PM Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com> wrote:
1




Hi Mr Boo,

Kindly amend the Labour item 8 to $2200. (not $3200)

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ikkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Boo seng yak <boojohnny@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 19 August 2022 3:25 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>;
Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Carrine Leong <carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg>;
jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg <jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg>; Chang Chee Sing
<claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: FINAL REVISION - SNA932P - TP ALLIANZ - SURVEYED 19 MAR 22

Hi Steve an dall,
Revised estimate, resurvey docs and photographs attached.
Please confirm repair cost of $17,700.30 @ 9 days exclude 1 Sun & 1 PH.

Your early closure is well appreciated.

Best regards - Johnny Boo



