
Erofia Motor Trading Pte Ltd
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #02-52
' AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit

Singapore 4L7883
T el: 67 527740 Fax: 67528669

E-Mail : erofia@singnet.com.sg
Co Registration No: 201202259N

Ref : E MT1997 I 22 / lt I FBNT 222H

Your reference:TO BE ADVISED

1,0 May 2022

AIG Asia Pacific lnsurance Pte Ltd

78 Shenton Way #07-16
AIG Building
Singapore 079120

Attn : Officer-l n-Cha rge ( Motor Claims Depa rtment)

Dear Sir

1. Final repair cost as per Surveyor's recommendation
2. Loss of Use (06 days X SS30.00/day) Repair Day + PRI

3. To provide towing service (receipt attached)

c

Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKT8885A AND FBN7222H ON 13 APRIL 2022

We are instructed by our client Muhammad Haikel Bin Mohammed Hussein to claim damages

against your insured SKT8885A in connection with a road traffic accident on L3 April 2022at about
08.30hrs along Gambas Avenue with our client's motorcycle registration number FBN7222H

As a result of the accident, our client's motor bike was damaged and our client has been put to loss

and expenses, particulars of which are as follows:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

BY HAND TO LKK

ss 6,700.00
ss 180.00
sS 35.00

Totalto Claim SS 6,915.00

Attached towing receipt and final repair bill for your early process of our claim

Kindly revert soonest

Thank you

Yours faithfully
Erofia Motor Trading Pte Ltd

Teo Hwa Heng





09 June 23



EROFIA MOTOR TRADING pTE LTD(2o12o22ss*l
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #02-62

Singapore 417883
Tel : 675277 40 F ax: 67 528669

H/P: 90696165 (Mr Teo)

INVOICE

Number Date
FBN7222H 1O-May-22

YOUR REF:
VEHICLE NO:
MAKE/MODEL:
NAME:

ADDRESS:

r
I

Page
1

FBN7222H
HONDA CB4OOSF MANUAL
AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD
78 SHENTON WAY #O7-16
AIG BUILDING
SINGAPORE 079120

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKT8885AAND FBN7222H ON 13 APRIL 2022

FINAL REPAIR COST AS PER SURVEYOR'S RECOMMENDATION

SUB-TOTAL:

SINGAPORE DOLLARS: SIX THOUSAND AND SEVEN HUNDRED ONLY

TOTAL:

6,700.00

S$ 6,700.00

6,700.00

EROFIA MOTOR T
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H/P No :9295 3O47

Received From

Vehicle No. :

From :

HanCphone No. :

Amount :

Crrtia--^

,fl
-1/ *.$35

Note : Vehicte is transporteci at owner's risk. The company acCepts no responsibility

for damages or other misdemeanor to your vehicte WhGt being transported

OFFACIA!- R,HCEiPT
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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 6 May 2022 09:25
To: ALANTAMWK@GMAIL.COM
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKT 8885A AND FBN 7222H ON 13/04/2022

Our Ref: CC6/AIG22003515/Uea3 
                    
 
6 May 2022                                            
 
TAM DONG SHEN 
 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKT 8885A AND FBN 7222H ON 13/04/2022 
 
We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against 
you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them. 
 
Kindly note that we have reviewed this matter and would like to advise that you and/or your authorized driver may not 
be absolved from blame for this accident. 
 
If you have evidence/information to prove that we should not settle the third party claim, kindly let us have them in 
writing within the next 10 days, after we shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant on the without 
prejudice basis and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by you/your driver against the other party’s 
insurer arising from this particular accident. 
 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial 
vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be 
deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.  
 
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 
Yours faithfully, 
 
 
Asher Sng 
Case Handler 
DID: 6841 6051 
Email: ashersng@lkkauto.com 
 
c.c.         AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd               
             (Motor Claims Dept) 
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Claim Audit

 

  AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

1 18 Apr
2022 16:17

Clm Dtl
Modified Claimant's Name: -> -. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

2 18 Apr
2022 16:17

Clm Veh Model
Changed (203353) HONDA CB400SF 399cc. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

3 18 Apr
2022 16:17 Clm Created Reg No: FBN7222H. Acct Date: 2022/04/13. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insur

ance Pte. Ltd. (SG). Workshop: Erofia Motor Trading Pte Ltd (KAKI BUKIT)
[A] HOW MEI

KWAN

4 18 Apr
2022 16:17

Adj Co
Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

5 18 Apr
2022 16:17

Adj Next Rpt
Changed Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2022/04/27 [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

6 18 Apr
2022 16:17

Adj Mandate
Set Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

7 18 Apr
2022 16:17

Clm Ins Co
Changed

[200005] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) -> [203630] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance
Pte. Ltd. (Express)

[A] Merimen
Administrator

8 18 Apr
2022 16:17 Label Added (20224):Field Survey. [A] Merimen

Administrator

9 18 Apr
2022 16:18 Label Added (19):Fastlane. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

10 18 Apr
2022 16:18

Adj Adjuster
Assigned [None] -> MARCUS CHUA [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

11 28 Jun
2022 16:48

Adj Rpt
Initiated

[A] Elaine Kuan
Hwa Meen

12 28 Jun
2022 16:48

Clm Dtl
Modified Claim Conclusion: -> 3. [A] Elaine Kuan

Hwa Meen

13 28 Jun
2022 16:48

Clm Dtl
Modified JPJ Reg. Date: -> 2018/11/27. [A] Elaine Kuan

Hwa Meen

14 28 Jun
2022 16:48

Clm Details
Notified

[A] Elaine Kuan
Hwa Meen

15 02 May
2023 11:13

Adj Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:6915.00:Liability: 100% (BOLA 11a) OI has been charged by Traffic Police. *Quant
um: $6,915.00 (all-in). Please refer to adjuster report for details. *For your approval pleas
e.

[A] Ezlyna

16 03 May
2023 15:02

Adj Next Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2022/04/27. Mandate Remarks: Approved, to settle not excee
ding the amount of $6,915.00. Please try to keep LOU within 4-5 days. subj to submission
of all supporting docs

[I] Tam, Ivan-WK

17 03 May
2023 15:02

Adj Mandate
Set

Approved:6915.00:Approved, to settle not exceeding the amount of $6,915.00. Please try t
o keep LOU within 4-5 days. subj to submission of all supporting docs [I] Tam, Ivan-WK

Date From       Date To       Audit Type None Go

ACTIVITY
[06/05/2022 09:22] Asher Sng Rong Yi:
Email to oi to notify claim.
[06/05/2022 09:22] Asher Sng Rong Yi:
FILE REVIEW: LIABILITY UNCLEAR / PENDING FOR EVIDENCE OR PIR

Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

Bill Ref No Bill Date Bill Type Acc Type Acc Name Co Name
(Branch) Ref 1 Ref 2 Amount

2784873 20 Apr 2022
15:56:49

TP Case
(Insurer) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (Express)

FBN7222H SKT8885A 11.00

2809993 28 Jun 2022
16:48:03

OD/TP Case
(Adjuster) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

LKK Auto
Consultants
Pte Ltd (HQ)

FBN7222H SKT8885A 11.00

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setlogin=0&CFID=107257193&CFTOKEN=8e20c72c67a2a42e-C3159F59-0CAD-0234-0AE4C32CCA489408&USID=11941&RID=1627091
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=0&CFID=107257193&CFTOKEN=8e20c72c67a2a42e-C3159F59-0CAD-0234-0AE4C32CCA489408&USID=11941&RID=1627091
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=1&personal=1&CFID=107257193&CFTOKEN=8e20c72c67a2a42e-C3159F59-0CAD-0234-0AE4C32CCA489408&USID=11941&RID=1627091
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_composemail&mode=0&CFID=107257193&CFTOKEN=8e20c72c67a2a42e-C3159F59-0CAD-0234-0AE4C32CCA489408&USID=11941&RID=1627091&urlback=/claims/index.cfm%3Ffusebox%3DMTRadjuster%26fuseaction%3Ddsp_viewhistory%26caseid%3D1084151%26extid%3D383834%26
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/undefined
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsec&fuseaction=act_logout&CFID=107257193&CFTOKEN=8e20c72c67a2a42e-C3159F59-0CAD-0234-0AE4C32CCA489408&USID=11941&RID=1627091
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