Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Fulco Autocare Pte Ltd <fulco0302@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 30 June 2022 4:20 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: CHINA-TP SLE 3777D DOA: 08/04/2022

Dear Shiau Chan,

We confirm Lump Sum $3,000 (before 6ST) and 03 repair days.

Best Regards,

Fulco Autocare Pte Ltd

On Thu, Jun 30, 2022 at 4:08 PM Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@|kkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Jenny,

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of Lump Sum $3,000.00/- with 03 days of repair, subject to their
approval.

Best Regards,
Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



