Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Florence Loh <fa_autoservices@falconair.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 30 May 2022 11:50 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR; andy

Subject: RE: BUDGET DIRECT - SLH 1066U DOA: 06/04/2022

Dear Shiau Chan,

Sorry for the delay.

COR confirm at Lump Sum $2,150.00 with 5 days repair.
Thank you.

Florence Loh

Falcon Air Auto Services Pte Ltd
176 Sin Ming Drive #01-06

Sin Ming Autocare

Singapore 575721

Tel: 6452 0880 Fax: 6454 7862

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 30 May 2022 11:25 AM

To: ANDY <andy@falconair.com.sg>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Florence Loh <fa_autoservices@falconair.com.sg>
Subject: RE: BUDGET DIRECT - SLH 1066U DOA: 06/04/2022

Dear Andy/Florence,
Any updates?

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 18 May 2022 3:18 PM

To: ANDY <andy@falconair.com.sg>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Florence Loh <fa_autoservices@falconair.com.sg>
Subject: BUDGET DIRECT - SLH 1066U DOA: 06/04/2022

Dear Andy/Florence,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of Lump Sum $2,150.00 with 5 days of repair, subject to their
approval.



Kindly check.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




