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RE: SMA 8822H OD ECICS

Angela Tan <angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg>
Mon 6/6/2022 10:26 AM
To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Leong Chee Kwong <cheekwong.leong@munichautocare.com.sg>;Lim Jia Haw <jiahaw.lim@munichautocare.com.sg>

Dear Denise,
 
Confirmed and finalise $10,700/=
 
Thank you.
 
 
Regards
Angela Tan
Motor Claims Executive (B&P Dept)
Email: angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg
Phone: +65 9644 3110
60, Jalan Lam Huat
#06-41/42/43/54/55 & #07-43
Carros Centre
Singapore 737869
 

 
 
 
 
From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Monday, 6 June 2022 9:20 AM

To: Leong Chee Kwong <cheekwong.leong@munichautocare.com.sg>; Angela Tan
<angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg>

Cc: Lim Jia Haw <jiahaw.lim@munichautocare.com.sg>

Subject: Re: SMA 8822H OD ECICS
 
Dear Angela,
 
As Spoken, Approval given for the final is $10,700, 8 days.
 
Please check and let us know
 
 
 
Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Leong Chee Kwong <cheekwong.leong@munichautocare.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 31 May 2022 1:14 pm

To: Angela Tan <angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg>; Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Lim Jia Haw <jiahaw.lim@munichautocare.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SMA 8822H OD ECICS
 
Hi Denise ,
 
As for request n pls kindly refer to the attached
 
thanks
 
From: Angela Tan <angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg> 

Sent: Tuesday, 31 May 2022 11:56 AM

To: Leong Chee Kwong <cheekwong.leong@munichautocare.com.sg>

Subject: Fwd: SMA 8822H OD ECICS
 
Please check and revert Denise. Thanks
 
Get Outlook for Android
 

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 31 May 2022, 08:40

To: Angela Tan <angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg>

Subject: SMA 8822H OD ECICS
 
Hi Angela,
 
got parts invoice for no. 31 - Clock Spring  & no. 32 Air Bag Computer Bag?
 
 
 
Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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