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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Sent: Monday, 18 July 2022 12:46 pm
To: Admin A; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Subject: Fwd: SJN1784Y & GBK3359P DOA 12.4.22
Attachments: INVOICE.pdf; PHOTO-2022-04-12-15-56-33 (1).jpg; PHOTO-2022-04-12-15-56-33.jpg; 

LOA.png; SJN 1784Y - PoliceReport.pdf; SJN 1784Y - SearchFee (GBK3359P).pdf; SJN 
1784Y - GIA report (11.04.2022).pdf

 
  

Dear Sir / Mdm ,   
 
Enclosed is the GIA report , TP report ,LTA fee , invoice ,  & LOA  
As request following :  
 
1 ) RC                   $ 5671.00 - ( $5300 + 7% GST - As agreed ) 
2) loss of use        $800 ( $100 - rental company  X 8 DAYS - 6 days recommend + 1 day waiting + 1 
Day weekend  ) 
3) LTA                   $7.45  
 
@ 100% TOTAL   $6478.45/- ( filter / cut in with scene photos )  
 
 
Please let us have your settlement soon . Thanks  
 
Best Regards  
Chris Chan  
GREEN FOREST AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD  
HP: 92712214 
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 GREEN FOREST AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD 
              8 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4,#05-25 PREMIER @ KAKI BUKIT SINGAPORE 415875

GRACE AUTO LEASING Date:
201723238H

Singapore 415875

Final Bill For Vehicle : SJN1784Y TOYOTA VIOS 

Descriptions AMOUNT

Lump Sum repair cost as recommended by $5,300.00
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

Total $5,300.00
GST 7% $371.00

Grand Total $5,671.00

S/ DLRS : FIVE THOUSAND SIX HUNDRED SEVENTY ONE  ONLY

                        INVOICE

18th July 22
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 GST Reg.No:
#05-25 Premier @ Kaki Bukit

Accident date: 11th APRIL 2022



Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2

Print Date/Time : 12 Apr 2022 / 12:16:14

Receipt Date/Time : 12 Apr 2022 / 12:15:00

Tax Invoice/Receipt

Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-220412-001546

Previous Receipt No. :

S/N Item Description/
Business Transaction Reference 
No.

Amount 
Before

GST (S$)

GST 
Amount 

(S$)

Amount 
After GST 

(S$)
Result of Insurance Enquiry - GBK3359P
As at 11 Apr 2022/15:15:00
Insurance Co: AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.

1 Insurance Enquiry - GBK3359P
Enquiry Fee 
20220412121130099454

7.00 0.49 7.49

Sub-Total 7.00 0.49 7.49

Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.49 7.49

Rounding Difference 0.04

Total Amount Payable 7.45

Paid By

526471XXXXXX3996 eNETS Credit Card 7.45

Total 7.45

Cash Change 0.00

Tendered Amount 7.45

Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service 
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee 

may apply.
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Sent: Wednesday, 27 April 2022 10:17 am
To: jonathan_goh@tanchong.com
Subject: <STANDARD LETTER> ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBK 3359P & SJN 1784Y ON 11/04/2022 

***

Importance: High

Our Ref: CC6/AIG22003445/Aga3                  
                                                                                                 
27 APRIL 2022 
 
METAQUIP TC INDUSTRIAL PTE LTD 
DRIVER: MOHAMAD NAZRI 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBK 3359P & SJN 1784Y ON 11/04/2022           

We refer to the above accident. We are the Appointed Surveyor and Loss Adjuster Company by your Motor 
Insurer (AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd.) to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under 
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them. 
 
This is to inform you that we received a Third Party Claim from SJN 1784Y. 
             
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to 
negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact 
us within 3 days from the date of this letter together with the supporting evidence (E:g: Video Footage / Traffic 
Police Investigation result). 
 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for 
commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD 
protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected. 
 
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 
c.c   AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd       
           (Motor Claims Dept) 
 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence 

should be made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be 

in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
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DID: 6749-4274 | MAIN: 6256 3561 | EMAIL: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| FAX: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 
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Claim Audit

 

 
AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

1
14 Apr
2022
10:20

Clm Dtl
Modified Claimant's Name: -> GRACE AUTO LEASING. Claimant's ID: -> 5XXXX089E. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

2
14 Apr
2022
10:20

Clm Veh
Model
Changed

(200942) TOYOTA VIOS 1.5 E (A). [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

3
14 Apr
2022
10:20

Clm Created
Reg No: SJN1784Y. Acct Date: 2022/04/11. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
(SG). TP Insurer: NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ). Workshop: Green Forest Automobile P
te Ltd (Kaki Bukit)

[A] HOW MEI
KWAN

4
14 Apr
2022
10:20

Adj Co
Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

5
14 Apr
2022
10:20

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2022/04/26 [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

6
14 Apr
2022
10:20

Adj
Mandate Set Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

7
14 Apr
2022
10:20

Clm Ins Co
Changed

[200005] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) -> [203630] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Exp
ress)

[A] Merimen
Administrator

8
14 Apr
2022
10:20

Label Added (20224):Field Survey. [A] Merimen
Administrator

9
14 Apr
2022
10:20

Label Added (19):Fastlane. [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

10
14 Apr
2022
10:20

Adj
Adjuster
Assigned

[None] -> ADRIAN LING [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

11
26 Apr
2022
10:05

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [A] Chong

Pui Lin

12
27 Apr
2022
10:08

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [A] Chong

Pui Lin

13
29 Apr
2022
09:48

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [I] Yong,

Joanne

14
29 Apr
2022
09:49

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [I] Yong,

Joanne

15
20 Jun
2022
14:51

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [I] Tan,

Wilson-KL

16
05 Aug
2022
14:38

Adj Rpt
Initiated

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

17
05 Aug
2022
14:38

Clm Dtl
Modified Claim Conclusion: -> 3.

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

18
05 Aug
2022
14:38

Clm Dtl
Modified JPJ Reg. Date: -> 2009/02/06.

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

19
05 Aug
2022
14:38

Clm Details
Notified

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

20
18 Aug
2022
16:39

Adj
Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:6158.45:LIABILITY: 100% (TP DRIVING STRAIGHT WITHIN LANE, OI DOING 3-POINT TURN FR
OM OPP DIRECTION
LANE)
CORw/GST: 5671.00 + LOU(8days x $60.00): 480.00 + SEARCH FEE: 7.45 =
6,158.45
06 RECOMMENDED REPAIR DAYS + 1PRS + 1WEEKEND = 8 DAYS

[A] Chong
Pui Lin

21
03 Sep
2022
11:35

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2022/04/26 [I] Yong,
Joanne

22
03 Sep
2022
11:35

Adj
Mandate Set Approved:6158.45. [I] Yong,

Joanne

23
07 Sep
2022
08:46

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [A] CHEW

HSIAO TONG

Date From       Date To       Audit Type None Go



ACTIVITY
No record



Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

Bill Ref No Bill Date Bill Type Acc Type Acc Name Co Name Ref 1 Ref 2 Amount

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setlogin=0&CFID=97354006&CFTOKEN=9dcfcddfc4157802-07DA2B40-FA9E-9140-DB467FAA0D4FB3D3&USID=3251&RID=4765043
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=0&CFID=97354006&CFTOKEN=9dcfcddfc4157802-07DA2B40-FA9E-9140-DB467FAA0D4FB3D3&USID=3251&RID=4765043
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=1&personal=1&CFID=97354006&CFTOKEN=9dcfcddfc4157802-07DA2B40-FA9E-9140-DB467FAA0D4FB3D3&USID=3251&RID=4765043
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_composemail&mode=0&CFID=97354006&CFTOKEN=9dcfcddfc4157802-07DA2B40-FA9E-9140-DB467FAA0D4FB3D3&USID=3251&RID=4765043&urlback=/claims/index.cfm%3Ffusebox%3DMTRadjuster%26fuseaction%3Ddsp_viewhistory%26caseid%3D1083431%26extid%3D383564%26
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/undefined
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsec&fuseaction=act_logout&CFID=97354006&CFTOKEN=9dcfcddfc4157802-07DA2B40-FA9E-9140-DB467FAA0D4FB3D3&USID=3251&RID=4765043
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(Branch)

2784474 19 Apr 2022
15:06:46

TP Case
(Insurer) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (Express)

SJN1784Y GBK3359P 11.00

2786973 27 Apr 2022
10:09:18 Video Upload Motor

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd.

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (SG)

SJN1784Y Chong Pui Lin xx.xx

2827013 05 Aug 2022
14:38:34

OD/TP Case
(Adjuster) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

LKK Auto
Consultants
Pte Ltd (HQ)

SJN1784Y GBK3359P 11.00







