Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 16 December 2022 5:11 PM

To: darren@completevms.com.sg; SUR

Subject: FW: Quote QU-0005 from Euro Autotech Pte Ltd for Complete VMS Pte Ltd-YL
3879C

Attachments: Quote # QUO005.pdf

Dear Darren,

“Without Prejudice”

COR at $53,200.00 @ 3 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Darren Chiu <darren@completevms.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 30 June 2022 1:29 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Fwd: Quote QU-0005 from Euro Autotech Pte Ltd for Complete VMS Pte Ltd

Hi Veron,

Attached with this email from the supplier for your reference.

Regards,
Darren Chiu

Complete VMS PTE LTD
The Premier One-Stop Vehicle Accident Claims Centre

Hp: 83332118

Tel: 64550012

Fax: 65540012

Block 176 Sin Ming Drive, #03-14 / 07

Sin Ming Autocare Complex, Singapore 575721



—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Mrs Tan <messaging-service @post.xero.com>

Date: Fri, Mar 18, 2022 at 3:04 PM

Subject: Quote QU-0005 from Euro Autotech Pte Ltd for Complete VMS Pte Ltd
To: <lihui@completevms.com.sg>, <darren@completevms.com.sg>

EURO AIUTOTECH

Hi Ms. Gan,

Thank you for your enquiry. Due to the tremendous increase of the logistics cost, we
have increased the unit rate of the product with effect from 14 March 2022. Here's the
revised quote QU-0005 attached.

Hope for your kind understanding and we look forward to your continual support.

If you have any questions, please let us know.

Thanks,
Euro Autotech Pte Ltd

Terms



