Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Asure Auto <claims@asureauto.co>

Sent: Thursday, 1 June 2023 8:59 PM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: OUR REF: M4738 PC5592U CNTP OD REQUEST FINALIZE

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Hi Huey Yon,
We would like to confirm your COR of lump sum $66,200.00 with 50 repair days. Thanks.

Best Regards,

Frankie Heng
M: (65) 96722347
E: claims@asureauto.co

Singapore

Asure Auto Pte. Ltd.
201437380M

1 Harvey Road #04-02
Singapore 369610

-- Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above
and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the
reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or
copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately

notify the sender and delete the mail.--

Data Privacy Policy Notice: Asure Group Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes stated in our Privacy Policy. This may
Include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service
providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for our Privacy Policy.

On Thu, 1 Jun 2023 at 15:44, Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@Ilkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Without prejudice

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of Lump sum $66,200.00 before excess $2,500.00 & GST
with 50 days of repair, subject to their approval.

Best Regards,

Huey Yon | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants

phone: 6256-3561 | email: hueyyon@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




From: Claims Asure Auto <claims@asureauto.co>

Sent: Wednesday, May 10, 2023 4:59 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: OUR REF: M4738 PC5592U CNTP OD REQUEST FINALIZE

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Hi Steve,

We refer to the above matter. Can we have a finalised amount for the said vehicle? Thanks

Best Regards,

Frankie Heng
M: (65) 96722347
E: claims@asureauto.co

Singapore

Asure Auto Pte. Ltd.
201437380M

1 Harvey Road #04-02
Singapore 369610

-- Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above
and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the
reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or
copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately

notify the sender and delete the mail.--

Data Privacy Policy Notice: Asure Group Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes stated in our Privacy Policy. This
may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party
service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for our Privacy Policy.



