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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: ENG HUEY NI <hneng@lonpac.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 1 June 2022 12:19 pm
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); KENNY LIM CHING GHEE
Subject: RE: Arrange for survey - SHD214J *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC22003433/Kga3 - Oref 

:21/22/22/VC05/025673
Attachments: image001.wmz

Lonpac External - Confidential 
 
Hi Cecilia, 
 
Thank you for taking my call this morning. 
 
As we are repudiating liability for this accident, please withdraw offer and cease 
negotiation with TP workshop, and request them to redirect the claim to our insured. 
 
Please let us have the final survey report and your invoice for survey. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
Best Regards 
 
Eng Huey Ni 
Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
DID: 6279 9244 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

 
 
 
 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Saturday, 21 May 2022 11:04 am 

To: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Arrange for survey - SHD214J *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC22003433/Kga3 - Oref :21/22/22/VC05/025673 
 
Hi kenny,  
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Sent: Wednesday, 1 June 2022 2:07 pm
To: 'Wai Yin Ng'
Cc: 'Jasmine Tan'; 'Claims'
Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SHD 214J [AAD2204-058] / OIV: YN 6624R / DOA: 12/04/2022

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Hi Wai Yin,  
 
Our principal revert that this case has been repudiated. Please direct your claim towards OI.  
 
We will close off the matter at our end.  
 
Thanks  
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be 
made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any 
inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6749-4274 | MAIN: 6256 3561 | EMAIL: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| FAX: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Wednesday, 1 June 2022 8:56 am 
To: 'Wai Yin Ng' <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg> 
Cc: 'Jasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; 'Claims' <claims@transcab.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SHD 214J [AAD2204-058] / OIV: YN 6624R / DOA: 12/04/2022 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Hi Wai Yin,  
 


