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Re: FBN 8422R LIMIT REPAIR OD AIG

Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Tue 19/4/2022 9:37 AM
To: Sbk E <sbk5643e@yahoo.com>

Dear Mr Kwan,

We were informed by AIG, Claim to be repudiated under breech of policy.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Sbk E <sbk5643e@yahoo.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 19 April 2022 9:02 am

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: FBN 8422R LIMIT REPAIR OD AIG
 
Dear Denise,


Good Day. Do you mind if we can get approval from AIG for this global sum repair before I
proceed. Thank you.


Regards,


Kwan S. H.

Director

Bike Production Pte Ltd


On Tuesday, April 19, 2022, 07:33:06 AM GMT+8, Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> wrote:




Hi,


Yes, All in at $6000 before excess n gst


Please note that for this amount subjected to insurance approval.


Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



On 18 Apr 2022, at 9:12 PM, Sbk E <sbk5643e@yahoo.com> wrote:




﻿
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Dear Denise,



Can you confirm to finalized at global sum of $6,000.00 before Excess and GST? Thanks.



Regards,



Kwan S. H.

Director
Bike Production Pte Ltd




On Monday, April 18, 2022, 04:18:26 PM GMT+8, Denise Tay (LKKAuto)
<denisetay@lkkauto.com> wrote:




Hi,


Limit repair at all in $6000/- please check if able to repair within(subjected to
insurance approval)








Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone:6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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