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Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: MTPRI <MTPRI@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 12 April, 2022 9:35 AM

To: assignments; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Cc: MTPRI; Foo Chit Yan (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd); Tan Wei Teck (Strides 

Automotive Services Pte Ltd); Karen Chan Siau Chin (Strides Automotive Services 

Pte Ltd)

Subject: FW: Notice to inspect our client's motor vehicle SKK808Z - Accident involving 

SKK808Z and SG1699R on 05.04.2022

Attachments: EST-SKK808Z.pdf

Ref: BUS/04/22/7001 

 

Dear Yan, 

 

Kindly survey on “ Without Prejudice” basis. 

 

TP: SKK808Z 

Insured: SG1699R 

Workshop: Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd 

 

Thank you. 

 

Regards, 

 

Hua Yen 

Claim Department 

 
Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd | 60 Woodlands Industrial Park E4 Singapore 757705 

DID: 6866 2650 | Fax: 6368 7421 | Email: HuaYen.Ong@strides.com.sg 

 

From: kangcar@singnet.com.sg <kangcar@singnet.com.sg>  

Sent: Monday, 11 April 2022 10:33 am 

To: MTPRI <MTPRI@smrt.com.sg> 

Cc: Kang Car (yahoo) <kangcar176@yahoo.com.sg> 

Subject: Notice to inspect our client's motor vehicle SKK808Z - Accident involving SKK808Z and SG1699R on 

05.04.2022 

 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of SMRT. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognise the sender 

and are expecting the content or attachment.  

 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE  

 

Your ref : SG1699R 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

 

Our client's motor vehicle no: SKK808Z that was damaged as a result of the above accident, is now lying at our 

premises/workshop, waiting for repairs to be carried out. 

 

As you are the insurers of motor vehicle SG1699R , we hereby give you notice to inspect our client's damaged motor 

vehicle at our premises/workshop.  If your representative/surveyor does not inspect our client's damaged motor 
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vehicle within the next two(2) days, we shall proceed to repair our client's damaged motor vehicle without any 

further notice and our client will thereafter look to you/your insured for the repair costs.  This is without prejudice 

to our client's claim for damages, loss of use and incidental loss. 

 

We attach herewith our estimate cost of repairs and  our client's accident  report for your reference. 

 

Please let us have your list of ten panel surveyors for our consideration. 

 

 

Thank you & Regards,  

Sharon 

Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd  

Tel: 6747 7636  

Fax: 6748 5071 

 


