Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Dear Veron,

Thiam Heng Huat <thh176@yahoo.com>
Friday, 22 April 2022 10:25 AM

Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto); Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Re: ESTIMATE FOR SKM7818M

We confirm repair costs at $280 (before GST) and 1 repair day.

Warmest regards,
Steven

Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd
82636295

On Friday, 22 April 2022, 10:23:51 am SGT, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Jenny,

Without Prejudice

Attached is the adjusted estimate of SKM 7818M

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of $280/- with 1 days of repair, subject to their approval.

Kindly check and reply.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
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From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 15 April 2022 8:14 PM

To: Thiam Heng Huat <thh176@yahoo.com>; Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: ESTIMATE FOR SKM7818M

Dear Steven,

Without Prejudice

Attached is the adjusted estimate of SKM 7818M

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of $380/- with 2 days of repair, subject to their approval.

Kindly check and reply.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
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From: Thiam Heng Huat [mailto:thh176@yahoo.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 13 April 2022 3:20 PM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
<veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Subject: ESTIMATE FOR SKM7818M

Dear Kenneth,

Please see estimate attached.

Warmest regards,
Steven
Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd

82636295



