Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 2 September 2022 10:02 AM
To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: Fw: PC 797D DOA : 06/04/22

CASE FINALISED

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the ELarth- Print only whenr necessary-

From: daud mohamad <mddaudn731@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 2 September 2022 10:00 am

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: PC 797D DOA : 06/04/22

Please proceed. Thank you.

REGARDS
DAUD

On Fri, Sep 2, 2022 at 9:24 AM Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote:
Hi Daud,

As spoken, we will be advising our principal a cost of repair L/S $3100.00 /- with 05
days of repair, subject to their approval.

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the ELarth- Print only wherr necessary-



