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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunauto1@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 11 April 2023 11:50 AM
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: FW: FW: 4th Email for Finalise: URGENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBL4418R & 

XE4750G AT 4009 ANG MO KIO AVE 10 TECHPLACE 1 ON 29 MARCH 2022 AT 
ABOUT 1015 HOURS|| PI.192521.wf

Dear Veron, please close it and move on, thanks. 
 
Best Regards 
Yi Xin 

Xin Yun Auto Pte Ltd 
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-23, 

Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875 
T: 63340858  | E: xinyunauto1@gmail.com 

 
 
On Tue, Apr 11, 2023 at 11:47 AM Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Yi Xin, 

  

  

“Without Prejudice” 

  

Our surveyor’s has review on the repair cost. 

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $2500/- with 5 days of repair, subject to their 
approval.  

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
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Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

From: Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunauto1@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, April 11, 2023 9:59 AM 
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: FW: FW: 4th Email for Finalise: URGENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBL4418R & XE4750G AT 4009 ANG 
MO KIO AVE 10 TECHPLACE 1 ON 29 MARCH 2022 AT ABOUT 1015 HOURS|| PI.192521.wf 

  

Dear Veron and Taufikh, 

  

Good morning, for van front cutting or welding work, we need to remove the dashboard, is due to safety reason. 

Please see the picture of removing the dashboard, could you please consider some labour and man-day time? 

  

Can we close this case at $2500 07days, thanks. 

  

Best Regards 

Yi Xin 
 

Xin Yun Auto Pte Ltd 
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-23, 

Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875 
T: 63340858  | E: xinyunauto1@gmail.com 

  

  

On Mon, Apr 10, 2023 at 7:34 AM Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Yi Xin, 
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Any update 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Wednesday, April 5, 2023 12:17 PM 
To: 'Xin Yun Auto Main' <xinyunauto1@gmail.com> 
Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: FW: 4th Email for Finalise: URGENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBL4418R & XE4750G AT 4009 ANG MO 
KIO AVE 10 TECHPLACE 1 ON 29 MARCH 2022 AT ABOUT 1015 HOURS|| PI.192521.wf 

  

Dear Yi Xin, 

  

  

“Without Prejudice” 

  

  

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $2,300/- with 4 days of repair, subject to their 
approval.  
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Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

From: Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunauto1@gmail.com>  
Sent: Friday, December 9, 2022 11:45 AM 
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: FW: 4th Email for Finalise: URGENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBL4418R & XE4750G AT 4009 ANG MO 
KIO AVE 10 TECHPLACE 1 ON 29 MARCH 2022 AT ABOUT 1015 HOURS|| PI.192521.wf 

  

Hi Veron and Taufikh, please help to finalise this case asap, accident date was at March 2022. 

Insurance is chasing me for final bill too, thanks. 

  

Best Regards 

Yi Xin 
 

Xin Yun Auto Pte Ltd 
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-23, 

Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875 
T: 63340858  | E: xinyunauto1@gmail.com 

  

  

On Sun, Nov 13, 2022 at 9:59 AM Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Taufikh, 
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Please finalize with repairer. CS/FCI22003237/Tvy3 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

  

From: Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunauto1@gmail.com>  
Sent: Saturday, 12 November 2022 2:20 PM 
To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: 4th Email for Finalise: URGENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBL4418R & XE4750G AT 4009 ANG MO KIO AVE 
10 TECHPLACE 1 ON 29 MARCH 2022 AT ABOUT 1015 HOURS|| PI.192521.wf 

  

Dear SUR team, 

  

Good morning, can i have the GBL4418R case finalise apap, thank you. 

  

Best Regards 

Yi Xin 

Xin Yun Auto Pte Ltd 
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-23, 

Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875 
T: 63340858  | E: xinyunauto1@gmail.com 
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On Fri, Oct 14, 2022 at 2:05 PM Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunauto1@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear SUR team, 

  

Good morning, can i have the GBL4418R case finalise apap, thank you. 

  

Best Regards 

Yi Xin 

Xin Yun Auto Pte Ltd 
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-23, 

Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875 
T: 63340858  | E: xinyunauto1@gmail.com 

  

  

On Mon, Aug 15, 2022 at 1:34 PM Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunauto1@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear SUR team, 

  

Good morning, can i have the GBL4418R case finalise apap, thank you. 

  

Best Regards 

Yi Xin 
 

Xin Yun Auto Pte Ltd 
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-23, 

Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875 
T: 63340858  | E: xinyunauto1@gmail.com 

  

  

On Wed, Aug 10, 2022 at 3:41 PM Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunauto1@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear LKK officer, 
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Good afternoon, we appointed you as SJE for the GBL4418R case. Can i follow up on finalise, thanks. 

  

Best Regards 

Yi Xin 
 

Xin Yun Auto Pte Ltd 
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-23, 

Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875 
T: 63340858  | E: xinyunauto1@gmail.com 

  

  


