Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: AIGSS Claims Recovery <GRS-ExpressRecovery@aig.com>

Sent: Thursday, 26 May 2022 10:50 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Laili, Shahzlan; Khoo, Kay-Eng; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto); AIGSS Claims Recovery

Subject: AlGencrypt: RE: REMINDER: Pending MINDEF Response - 1845724197SG [
REMINDER ]

Without Prejudice
Dear Hsiao Tong,

We have received your payment and case has been closed at our end.

Thank you.
Sincerely,

Mimi Zarina

AlIG

Senior Recovery Representative — Claims Recovery
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way #10-16 Singapore 079120

Tel 65-68307871

GRS-ExpressRecovery@aig.com | www.aig.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments hereto) is confidential and may be protected by legal privileges and work product immunities. If
you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. Receipt by anyone other than the intended recipient is not a
waiver of any attorney-client or work product privilege. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command
and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any
virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that
it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any
loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: 26 May, 2022 9:52 AM

To: AIGSS Claims Recovery <GRS-ExpressRecovery@aig.com>

Cc: Laili, Shahzlan <Shahzlan.Laili@aig.com>; Dally Amri, Mimi Zarina <MimiZarina.DallyAmri@aig.com>; Khoo, Kay-Eng
<Kay-Eng.Khoo@aig.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: REMINDER: Pending MINDEF Response - 1845724197SG [ REMINDER ]

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.
Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Kindly confirm if you have received payment.

Please acknowledge receipt of payment.



Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 25 May 2022 5:34 PM

To: AIGSS Claims Recovery <GRS-ExpressRecovery@aig.com>

Cc: Laili, Shahzlan <Shahzlan.Laili@aig.com>; Dally Amri, Mimi Zarina <MimiZarina.DallyAmri@aig.com>; Khoo, Kay-Eng
<Kay-Eng.Khoo@aig.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: REMINDER: Pending MINDEF Response - 1845724197SG [ REMINDER ]

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Kindly confirm if you have received payment.
Please acknowledge receipt of payment.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 4 May 2022 11:19 AM

To: AIGSS Claims Recovery <GRS-ExpressRecovery@aig.com>

Cc: Laili, Shahzlan <Shahzlan.Laili@aig.com>; Dally Amri, Mimi Zarina <MimiZarina.DallyAmri@aig.com>; Khoo, Kay-Eng
<Kay-Eng.Khoo@aig.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: REMINDER: Pending MINDEF Response - 1845724197SG [ REMINDER ]
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Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Please be informed that we have processed the payment by UOB GIRO on 30.Apr.22. Refer to screenshot below for your

easy reference.

Thank you.

To

Payee's account details

aveEe Mame

AI.G Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

L

CITISGSEHH

0010267104

Amount & When

300047202

s5GD

Paves Pelarsnce
IYEE REler ecE

184572419756

Pavrienl D

TCA RECOVERY CLAIM

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

Lars Loy

3G

Barik Marme § Bstiiurion MNarme

CITIBANK MNA SINGAPORE

1,551.01

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)



