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Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 5 April, 2022 5:39 PM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: Ong Shiying

Subject: FW: REQUEST FOR PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR SLT 5014E     DOA: 02.04.2022

Internal 

 

Dear LKK 

 

FYA pls  

 

 

  

   Shanti. R 
   Claims Service  
   Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C 
   79 Robinson Road #09-01 I Singapore 068897 
   Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg 
 

    
 
    This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /   
    or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of  
    this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.    
    Thank you. 
  
 � Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 

 

From: Ong Shiying <shiying.ong@fastechauto.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, 5 April 2022 11:54 am 

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> 

Cc: Jason <Jason@fastechauto.com.sg>; Ashley Chia <ashley.chia@fastechauto.com.sg> 

Subject: [EXT] RE: REQUEST FOR PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR SLT 5014E DOA: 02.04.2022 

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Sir / Madam, 

 

Second reminder, the surveyor have yet to survey the vehicle. 

 

Please inform them ASAP. 

 

Thank You 

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Shiying 

Fastech Auto Pte Ltd 

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-46/48/50 

Autobay Singapore 417883 
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Tel: 6746 5405 

Fax: 6745 8520 

 

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without 

prejudice to any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/ claimant. 
 

From: Ong Shiying  

Sent: Tuesday, 5 April 2022 9:53 am 

To: 'Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore)' <claims@allianz.com.sg> 

Cc: Jason <Jason@fastechauto.com.sg>; Ashley Chia <ashley.chia@fastechauto.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR SLT 5014E DOA: 02.04.2022 

 

Without Prejudice  

  

Dear Sir / Madam, 

Please arrange (Kenneth Kong Seng Cheong

Kenneth Kong Seng CheongKenneth Kong Seng Cheong

Kenneth Kong Seng Cheong) to conduct the pre- repair survey. 

  

 

Thank You  

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Shiying 

Fastech Auto Pte Ltd 

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-46/48/50 

Autobay Singapore 417883 

Tel: 6746 5405 

Fax: 6745 8520 

 

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without 

prejudice to any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/ claimant. 

 

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, 5 April 2022 9:30 am 

To: Ong Shiying <shiying.ong@fastechauto.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR SLT 5014E DOA: 02.04.2022 

 

Internal 

 

Our ref: 800SWAISCL2022-0079/SL-XE4190Y 

 

“Without Prejudice” 

 

Dear Sir/ Madam, 

 

Kindly provide us the GIA report. 

 

Enclosed the list of surveyor for your consideration:- 

TT Rajan 

Li Lewei 

Justin Ee 
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Mohammed Rasul Bin 

Mohd Yunus 

Patrick Soo 

Kenneth Kong Seng 

Cheong 

Billy Loh 

Mohammed Nazril Bin 

Abdullah 

Liew Kong Ho 

Ben Chua 

  

Please let us know whom you are agreeable to appoint from the above. 

  

 
Shanti. R 

Claims Service  

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C 

79 Robinson Road #09-01 I Singapore 068897 

Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg 

  

 
  

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /  

or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of  

this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.  

Thank you. 

  

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 

 

From: Ong Shiying <shiying.ong@fastechauto.com.sg>  

Sent: Monday, 4 April 2022 4:50 pm 

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> 

Cc: Jason <Jason@fastechauto.com.sg>; Ashley Chia <ashley.chia@fastechauto.com.sg> 

Subject: [EXT] RE: REQUEST FOR PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR SLT 5014E DOA: 02.04.2022 

 

Without Prejudice  

  

Dear Sir / Madam, 

 

Please provide the surveyor list for above mention. 

 

Thank You 

 

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Shiying 

Fastech Auto Pte Ltd 

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-46/48/50 

Autobay Singapore 417883 
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Tel: 6746 5405 

Fax: 6745 8520 

 

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without 

prejudice to any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/ claimant. 
 

From: Ong Shiying  

Sent: Monday, 4 April 2022 12:30 pm 

To: claims@allianz.com.sg 

Cc: Jason <Jason@fastechauto.com.sg>; Ashley Chia <ashley.chia@fastechauto.com.sg> 

Subject: REQUEST FOR PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR SLT 5014E DOA: 02.04.2022 

 

Without Prejudice  
  
Dear Sir / Madam, 
  
Your insured’s vehicle: XE 4190Y. 
  
Date of accident: 02/04/2022  
  
Please arrange  Pre-repair Inspection for my client’s vehicle no: SLT 5014E. 
  
In accordance to APPENDIX C Pre-action Protocol for Non-Injury Motor Accident Cases of PRACTICE 

DIRECTIONS  
AMENDMENT NO. 1 OF 2016 paragraph 2.3, please provide a list of at least 10 motor surveyors within 2 

days of the notice. 
  
  
Thank you  

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Shiying 

Fastech Auto Pte Ltd 

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-46/48/50 

Autobay Singapore 417883 

Tel: 6746 5405 

Fax: 6745 8520 

 

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without 

prejudice to any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/ claimant. 

 


