Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Desmond Toh <desmondtoh@honda.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 25 May 2022 8:39 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: SLS1855B - TP CLAIM AGAINST XD3894L DOA: 30.30.2022 LKK REF :
CC4/LPC22003153/Gpa3

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Below attach is our bank detail,

Account Name: Kah Motor Co. Sdn Bhd

Bank Name: Citibank N.A

Bank Account No.: 0-012014-015

Type of Account: Current

Branch Name: Capital Square

Bank Code: 7214

Branch Code: 001

Branch Address: Asia Square Tower 1, 8 Marina View #16-01, Singapore 018960
SWIFT Code: CITISGSG

Please email to AR@honda.com.sg for the remittance details.

Best Regards,

Desmond Toh

Bodyshop Supervisor
Mandai Body Repair & Paint

Honda Singapore

Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd.
8 Mandai Estate
Singapore 729905

DID:: 6514 5848

Web: www.honda.com.sg

N

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 25 May 2022 8:23 am

To: Desmond Toh <desmondtoh@honda.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SLS1855B - TP CLAIM AGAINST XD3894L DOA: 30.30.2022 LKK REF : CC4/LPC22003153/Gpa3

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize
the sender and know the content is safe.

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) | $6,692.08 (36,254.28 + 7%GST) |
1




