Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 9 June 2022 8:23 PM

To: Richmond Ho

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Final Bill For SKK3008X

Attachments: SKK 3008 supp.pdf; SKK 3008 main estimate1.pdf
Hi Richmond,

Finalize amount correct. Please proceed.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 9 June 2022 3:34 pm

To: Richmond Ho <richmond.ho@wearnes.com>
Subject: Final Bill For SKK3008X

Hi Richmond,

Kindly request photo ? item, Bumper reflector LH - $170.50.



Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ikkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Richmond Ho <richmond.ho@wearnes.com>
Sent: Thursday, 9 June 2022 2:46 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Final Bill For SKK3008X

Hi Steve

Please see attached for the final bill.

Richmond Ho
Senior Service Consultant
Body & Paint — Insurance Claim

Weames Automotive Pte Ltd

V 249 Alexandra Road Singapore 159935

D (65) 6430 4390 M (65) 9176 8543
WEARMNES winw weamesauto.com  fichmond. ho@wearnes.com

This email, including any affachment, is confidential and may also be prvileged.
If your have recsived it in armor, pleasse nalify us immedialely by reply email and then delste this message from your sysiem.
Flease da not copy it or use if for any purpass, ar disclose s contents or any affachment fo any ather persan. Thank you.



