Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 26 April 2022 16:04
To: Yan
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: Accident involving SFH2332R and Your Ref: SGZ240D - DOA: 31/03/2022 *** LKK
REF: CC6/AIG22003078/ea3
Attachments: WITHNESS POLICE STATEMENT.pdf
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS
Hi Sir,

We refer to the above matter.
Enclosed a copy of insured witness statement for your easy reference.

Our principal has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the entire negligence of your client changed lane and collided into
our insured vehicle.

The eye witness that was stationary infront of your client is willing to be a witness on the mention accident.

Under such a circumstances, we regret to inform you that we have our principal instruction to deny liability and
unable to look into your client’s claim.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | did: 6841-6051 | Mobile: 8839 9816
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 4 April 2022 16:45

To: Yan <mg3solution@gmail.com>

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident involving SFH2332R and Your Ref: SGZ240D - DOA: 31/03/2022 *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG22003078/ea3

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI’s sketch plan and statement.



Sketch Plan

Describe Circumstances of the Accldent
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Please provide us the following and arrange for survey.
e evidence i.e. video and scene photo
e PIR result (if any)
e Estimated cost of repair

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Asher.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Yan <mg3solution@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 4 April, 2022 11:32 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Accident involving SFH2332R and Your Ref: SGZ240D - DOA: 31/03/2022

Dear Mei Kwan,



Please refer to attached.

We would like to check if report has been made by your insured. If yes, kindly let us have a copy of your insured statement.
Thank You.

Best Regards,
Jamie Yan

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 (South Wing)
#04-01 Vicom Inspection Centre
Singapore 415933

Tel : 6744 4165

Fax : 6744 4604



