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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 18 May 2022 9:00 PM

To: AutoInsure (Claims)

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: OUR REF: M4626 GBF1228Z DOA: 28/03/2022 OD CASE REQUEST FINALIZATION 

AMOUNT

Hi Siew, 

 

Insurance instruction repair Lump-sum. We cannot calculate part by part. Do you agree ? 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Thanks. 

 
Best Regards, 
Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: AutoInsure (Claims) <claims01@autoinsure.com.sg> 

Sent: Wednesday, 18 May 2022 6:05 pm 

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: OUR REF: M4626 GBF1228Z DOA: 28/03/2022 OD CASE REQUEST FINALIZATION AMOUNT  

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 

Dear Steve, 
 

We refer to the above matter. 
 

Kindly refer to our supplementary estimate, audatex finalise report, damaged parts photos, before paint 
photos & supplier invoices as attached. 
 

Please be informed we also submitted audatex finalise report and supplementary estimate via audatex & 
merimen system. 
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Thank You. 

 

Best Regards, 

  

MH Siew 

Estimator 
  

M: (65) 9352 1129 

T: (65)  3157 2631 

E: claims01@autoinsure.com.sg 

 
Main Branch | Branch West | Branch East 
Auto Insure Pte Ltd (Biz:201437380M) 
6 Marsiling Lane S739145 

  
t: (65) 3157 2626 

f: (65) 6368 0081 

e: enquiry@autoinsure.com.sg 

  
Website / General Enquiry / Facebook / Instagram 

 


