Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Attachments:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for your acceptance.

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Tuesday, 12 July 2022 4:35 PM

Hua Meng

RE: Your Ref: SLP9675S // LKK Ref: CC6/CTI22002972/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING
GBH9791A(CHINA TAIPING) AND SLP9675S ON 28/03/2022]

DV_SLP9675S.pdf

Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Hua Meng <huameng@live.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 7 July 2022 1:55 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SLP9675S // LKK Ref: CC6/CT122002972/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH9791A(CHINA
TAIPING) AND SLP9675S ON 28/03/2022]

Dear Xiao Tong

Kindly accept the offer and let us have the DV.

Thank you.

Regards,
Jing Yee

Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop



1, Kaki Bukit Avenue 6,
BLK C #01-34/#01-61
Singapore 417883

Tel: 6746 5519

Fax: 6743 4896

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 7 July 2022 9:35 AM

To: Hua Meng <huameng@live.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SLP9675S // LKK Ref: CC6/CTI22002972/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH9791A(CHINA
TAIPING) AND SLP9675S ON 28/03/2022]

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement at a global sum of $17,900.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408933)

From: Hua Meng <huameng®@live.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 6 July 2022 2:54 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SLP9675S // LKK Ref: CC6/CT122002972/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH9791A(CHINA
TAIPING) AND SLP9675S ON 28/03/2022]

Dear Xiao Tong

Kindly expedite for this matter.
We may pass to solicitor if no settlement by 13 July 2022.

Thank you.



Regards,

Jing Yee

Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop
1, Kaki Bukit Avenue 6,

BLK C #01-34/#01-61

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6746 5519

Fax: 6743 4896

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 4 July 2022 5:22 PM

To: Hua Meng <huameng@live.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SLP9675S // LKK Ref: CC6/CTI122002972/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH9791A(CHINA
TAIPING) AND SLP9675S ON 28/03/2022]

Without Prejudice
Dear Jing Yee,
We are still pending for approval from our principal.

We will follow up and get back to you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Hua Meng <huameng®@live.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 4 July 2022 11:28 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SLP9675S // LKK Ref: CC6/CT122002972/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH9791A(CHINA
TAIPING) AND SLP9675S ON 28/03/2022]

Dear Xiao Tong

Kindly let us have the update.



Thank you.

Regards,

Jing Yee

Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop
1, Kaki Bukit Avenue 6,

BLK C #01-34/#01-61

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6746 5519

Fax: 6743 4896

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 16 June 2022 9:41 AM

To: Hua Meng <huameng@live.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SLP9675S // LKK Ref: CC6/CTI22002972/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH9791A(CHINA
TAIPING) AND SLP9675S ON 28/03/2022]

Without Prejudice

Dear Jing Yee,

We are preparing report to seek mandate from our principal.
We will expedite the matter.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Hua Meng <huameng@Ilive.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 14 June 2022 2:44 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SLP9675S // LKK Ref: CC6/CTI22002972/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH9791A(CHINA
TAIPING) AND SLP9675S ON 28/03/2022]




Hi Xiao Tong
Any update for this matter?

Thank you.

Regards,

Jing Yee

Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop
1, Kaki Bukit Avenue 6,

BLK C #01-34/#01-61

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6746 5519

Fax: 6743 4896

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 31 May 2022 5:33 PM

To: Hua Meng <huameng@live.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SLP9675S // LKK Ref: CC6/CTI22002972/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH9791A(CHINA
TAIPING) AND SLP9675S ON 28/03/2022]

Without Prejudice
Hi Jing Yee,
As spoken earlier, we are pending for marked estimate from our surveyor.

We will expedite the matter, Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408933)

From: Hua Meng <huameng@Ilive.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 31 May 2022 2:16 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>




Subject: RE: Your Ref: SLP9675S // LKK Ref: CC6/CTI122002972/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH9791A(CHINA
TAIPING) AND SLP9675S ON 28/03/2022]
Importance: High

Dear Xiao Tong

We refer to the LOD and relevant documents sent on 28/04/2022.
We had yet to receive your reply.
Kindly let us have the offer soonest.

Thank you.

Regards,

Jing Yee

Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop
1, Kaki Bukit Avenue 6,

BLK C #01-34/#01-61

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6746 5519

Fax: 6743 4896

From: Hua Meng

Sent: Thursday, 28 April 2022 5:45 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SLP9675S // LKK Ref: CC6/CTI122002972/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH9791A(CHINA
TAIPING) AND SLP9675S ON 28/03/2022]

Importance: High

Dear Xiao Tong

Kindly refer to the LOD and relevant documents attached for your review.
Kindly let us have the offer soonest.

Thank you.

Regards,

Jing Yee

Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop
1, Kaki Bukit Avenue 6,

BLK C #01-34/#01-61

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6746 5519

Fax: 6743 4896

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 6 April 2022 12:24 PM

To: Hua Meng <huameng@live.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SLP9675S // LKK Ref: CC6/CT122002972/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH9791A(CHINA
TAIPING) AND SLP9675S ON 28/03/2022]

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,



We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under
BOLA (subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned
case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to
your client’s vehicle and admission of any liability to our Insured’s part. The final repair cost is subjected to the
consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the
number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor and approved by our principal.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408933)

From: Hua Meng <huameng®@live.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 5 April 2022 4:00 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SLP9675S // LKK Ref: CC6/CT122002972/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH9791A(CHINA
TAIPING) AND SLP9675S ON 28/03/2022]

Dear Xiao Tong

Kindly refer to the video footage attached.
Kindly let us have the liability.

Thank you.

Regards,

Jing Yee

Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop
1, Kaki Bukit Avenue 6,

BLK C #01-34/#01-61

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6746 5519



Fax: 6743 4896

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 4 April 2022 12:00 PM

To: Hua Meng <huameng@live.com.sg>

Subject: Your Ref: SLP9675S // LKK Ref: CC6/CT122002972/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH9791A(CHINA TAIPING)
AND SLP9675S ON 28/03/2022]

Your Ref: SLP9675S Without Prejudice
LKK Ref: CC6/CTI122002972/Apa3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH9791A(CHINA TAIPING) AND SLP9675S ON 28/03/2022
We refer to the above matter.

Attached is a copy of our insured accident report for your easy reference.

We would like to request for a copy of your client car video footage as stated in his accident report for our necessary
action.

Appreciate an early reply.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)




