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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 7 June 2022 4:59 PM

To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject:
转发: S2M03W3N_[TP REF:MKR/404/10242/2022/jk.xy]_Accident Involving SHA899Z 

& BICYCLE _along_PASIR RIS DRIVE 12 on 16/03/2022 22:30 PersonalAutoLine

     

发件人

发件人发件人

发件人: IWAN SINARDINATA <iwan1979@gmail.com> 

已发送

已发送已发送

已发送: 2022年 6月 7日 16:58:01 (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore 

收件人

收件人收件人

收件人: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> 

抄送

抄送抄送

抄送: joshua@roypartners.com.sg <joshua@roypartners.com.sg>; Roy Monoj Kumar <roy@roypartners.com.sg>; 

xinyu@roypartners.com.sg <xinyu@roypartners.com.sg> 

主题

主题主题

主题: Re: S2M03W3N_[TP REF:MKR/404/10242/2022/jk.xy]_Accident Involving SHA899Z & BICYCLE _along_PASIR 

RIS DRIVE 12 on 16/03/2022 22:30 PersonalAutoLine 

Dear Guo Qiang, 

 

 

Thanks for your update. 

Keeping my lawyers (Mr. Joshua / Mr. Roy) in loop in case you need to discuss it with 

them. 

 

Aside to Mr. @joshua@roypartners.com.sg / @Roy Monoj Kumar hereby the given 

principal cost of repair from LKK Auto (our appointed SJE) for your review. 

 

Thank you and stay safe. 

 

Best Regards, 

Iwan Sinardinata 

 

 

On Tue, Jun 7, 2022 at 9:19 AM Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> wrote: 
Dear Iwan, 
  
“Without Prejudice” 

  
We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of $6840.5/-, subject to their approval. 
  
Regards, 
Guo Qiang 

 

 

发件人

发件人发件人

发件人: IWAN SINARDINATA <iwan1979@gmail.com> 

发送时间

发送时间发送时间

发送时间: 2022年 4月 13日 19:36 

收件人

收件人收件人

收件人: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> 

抄送

抄送抄送

抄送: Roy Monoj Kumar <roy@roypartners.com.sg>; xinyu@roypartners.com.sg <xinyu@roypartners.com.sg>; 

joshua@roypartners.com.sg <joshua@roypartners.com.sg> 
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主题

主题主题

主题: Re: S2M03W3N_[TP REF:MKR/404/10242/2022/jk.xy]_Accident Involving SHA899Z & BICYCLE _along_PASIR 

RIS DRIVE 12 on 16/03/2022 22:30 PersonalAutoLine  

  

Dear Mr. Guo Xiang, 

 

As per our call, the total is SGD 6,840.5 comprising the following details: 

1. Bicycle: SGD 5,391.72 (refer to PDF filename:1. Bicycle: SGD 5,391.72 (refer to PDF filename:1. Bicycle: SGD 5,391.72 (refer to PDF filename:1. Bicycle: SGD 5,391.72 (refer to PDF filename:    invoicesinvoicesinvoicesinvoices----bicycle)bicycle)bicycle)bicycle) 

- Bicycle + Delivery: SGD 5,020.30 (refer to page 6) 

- GST + fee: SGD 371.42 (refer to page 7) 

 

 
 

2. Pedal: SGD 1,006.75 (refer to PDF filename:2. Pedal: SGD 1,006.75 (refer to PDF filename:2. Pedal: SGD 1,006.75 (refer to PDF filename:2. Pedal: SGD 1,006.75 (refer to PDF filename:    invoicesinvoicesinvoicesinvoices----pedal)pedal)pedal)pedal) 

- Pedal + Delivery: EUR 586.52 / SGD 931.70 (refer to page 1) 

- GST + fee: SGD 75.05 (refer to page 4) 

 

 

 
 

3. Helmet: SGD 442.03 (refer to PDF filename: invoices3. Helmet: SGD 442.03 (refer to PDF filename: invoices3. Helmet: SGD 442.03 (refer to PDF filename: invoices3. Helmet: SGD 442.03 (refer to PDF filename: invoices----helmet)helmet)helmet)helmet) 

- Helmet: EUR 255.16 / SGD 407.03 (refer to page 1) 

- Delivery: SGD 35 (refer to page 2) 

 

 

 
 

Feel free to let me know if you need further information. 

 

Thank you and stay safe. 

 

Best Regards, 

Iwan Sinardinata 
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On Tue, Apr 12, 2022 at 11:42 PM IWAN SINARDINATA <iwan1979@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Mr. Guo Qiang, 

 

Thanks for your patience. 

As discussed during your inspection, enclosed herewith the damage assessment report 

as well as the necessary invoices for your references. 

For the photos, I believe that you have taken sufficient evidence pointed out by the 

mechanic during your inspection. 

 

Feel free to let me know if you need further information. 

 

Thank you and stay safe. 

 

Best Regards, 

Iwan Sinardinata 

  

From:From:From:From: do not reply <donotreply@axa.com.sg>  

Sent:Sent:Sent:Sent: Tuesday, 29 March 2022 2:11 pm 

To:To:To:To: xinyu@roypartners.com.sg 

Cc:Cc:Cc:Cc: filenet-ctom-p-sg <filenet-ctom-p-sg@axa.com.hk> 

Subject:Subject:Subject:Subject: S2M03W3N_[TP REF:MKR/404/10242/2022/jk.xy]_Accident Involving SHA899Z & 

BICYCLE _along_PASIR RIS DRIVE 12 on 16/03/2022 22:30 PersonalAutoLine 

  

‘

‘‘

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

WITHOUT PREJUDICE’WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS

SAVE AS TO COSTSSAVE AS TO COSTS

SAVE AS TO COSTS 

  

Please do not reply to this email as we are not able to respond to messages sent to this email. We seek your 
cooperation to send all replies to motor.survey@axa.com.sg 

  

Dear Sir,  

  

We want to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle 

jointly with your client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in 

the attached list below to conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a S

SS

Single J

JJ

Joint E

EE

Expert. 

  

List of our motor surveyors:

List of our motor surveyors:List of our motor surveyors:

List of our motor surveyors: 

1. LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
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1. Vicom Ltd 

1. AXA in house surveyor 

  

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these 

motor surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select one or more of the listed motor surveyors. 

We will bear the cost of the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert. Meanwhile, 

please furnish us with estimate quotation in order for our surveyor to complete the pre repair 

survey.  

  

If there be any injury claims by your client, please combine it in one Letter of Demand in light of 

If there be any injury claims by your client, please combine it in one Letter of Demand in light of If there be any injury claims by your client, please combine it in one Letter of Demand in light of 

If there be any injury claims by your client, please combine it in one Letter of Demand in light of 

one caus

one causone caus

one cause of action, save as to costs and expenses.

e of action, save as to costs and expenses.e of action, save as to costs and expenses.

e of action, save as to costs and expenses. 

  

Should you have any other queries, please feel free to contact our Claims Service Team at 1800-8804888. 

  

Regards 

Shailendra 

  

  

  

  

From:From:From:From: xinyu@roypartners.com.sg <xinyu@roypartners.com.sg>  

Sent:Sent:Sent:Sent: Tuesday, 29 March 2022 1:06 PM 

To:To:To:To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey@axa.com.sg> 

Subject:Subject:Subject:Subject: S2M03W3N [EXTERNAL] PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION 

  

Without Prejudice 

Save as to cost 

  

Our Ref: MKR/404/10242/2022/jk.xy 

Your Ref: Your insured vehicle SHA 899Z 
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Dear Sirs, 

  

CLAIMANT:                IWAN SINARDINATA (CYCLIST) 

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING CYCLIST AND VEHICLE NO. SHA 899Z ALONG PASIR RIS 
DRIVE 12 ON 16.03.2022 AT ABOUT 2230HOURS. 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

We act for IWAN SINARDINATA, the owner of the cyclist involved in the above mentioned accident. 

  

We are instructed by our client to notify you of a road traffic accident on 16.03.2022 at about 2230 
hours along PASIR RIS DRIVE involving our client’s bicycle and motor vehicle registration number 
SHA 889Z driven by your insured at the material time. A copy of his traffic police report is enclosed.  

  

As a result of the accident, our client’s bicycle has been damaged. Before our client proceed to repair 
the damaged bicycle, please let us know within two (2) working days of your receipt of this notice 
whether you would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of our client’s bicycle at our client’s residential 
place, BLK 176D EDGEFIELD PLAINS #16-204 SINGAPORE 824176. Your said surveyor may 
contact our client, Iwan, at 9090 0097 to arrange the said inspection. If we do not receive any reply 
from you within the stipulated timeline, our client shall proceed to repair the bicycle without further 
reference to you. 

  

In view of the latest advisory on COVID-19 announced on 3rd April 2020, our office is operating on 100% 
telecommuting via email. Please do not send any letter, document and notice to our fax number 6536 
1963 with immediate effect. We will not be able to answer any calls too. Please direct all 

correspondence to us by email. 

  

Thanks and regards, 

  

Xin Yu 

M/s Roy & Partners 

133 New Bridge Road 

#08-09 Chinatown Point 

Singapore 059413 

Tel : 6536 8466      Fax :  6536 1963 

Email : xinyu@roypartners.com.sg 
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IMPORTANT NOTE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged.  If you are not the intended 

recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this email is unauthorised and 
strictly prohibited.  If you have received this email in error, please notify the sender immediately.  You should also 
delete and destroy all copies of it.  Thank you. 

  

-----Disclaimer----- 

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the 

named addressee. If you are not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, 

disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have received this message 

by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in 

this message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those 

of AXA Singapore - Externals or any other entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise 

stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.  

  

Internal 

-----Disclaimer----- 

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the 

named addressee. If you are not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, 

disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have received this message 

by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in 

this message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those 

of AXA Singapore - Externals or any other entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise 

stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.  

  

Internal 

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by  

AXA except where provided for in a written agreement between you and AXA. Any  

unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is  

prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify  

the sender immediately. 


