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Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 28 March, 2022 4:45 PM

To: Summer (LKK Auto); assignments@lkkauto.com; sur@lkkauto.com

Cc: Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Eileen Lee

Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10014430/EE || OI-SKZ9449M (White) TP-SGU9128M || Est: 

$7,293.92 || DING AUTO PTE LTD

Attachments: Estimate.pdf; TP REPORT.pdf; TP PICS.pdf; OI REPORT SKZ9449M.pdf

Hi Team 

 

We wish to appoint LKK to conduct survey for the TP vehicle number: SGU9128M (VNI) 

 

Please assign Mr. Kenneth Kong   

 

DING AUTO PTE LTD 

176 Sin Ming Drive #04-06 

Sin Ming Autocare 

Singapore 575721 

 

Contact: 92313123 / Kenneth Ding 

 

Both GIA reports and estimate attached. 

 

 

Thank you. 

 

Warmest Regards, 

 

Shafawati Md Rabu 

Admin Executive, Claims 

 

T +65 6989 3697 

F +65 6725 0853   

E shafawati.m@budgetdirect.com.sg 

 

 
 

Customer Care +65 6221 2111 

Claims +65 6221 2199 

Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199 

 

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01 

Singapore Shopping Centre 

Singapore 

239924                                                                                                                                  

budgetdirect.com.sg 
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Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget 

Direct Insurance. 

 

From: Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>  

Sent: Monday, 28 March 2022 3:18 PM 

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 

Cc: 'SA 0406' <sa0406@dingauto.sg>; 'Accounts ( Ding Auto )' <accounts@dingauto.sg> 

Subject: RE: PRI Survey Request on 26/03/2022 || C10014430 || TP CLAIM: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGU9128M AND 

SKZ9449M DOA 24/03/2022: CHECK LIABILITY 

 

Dear Shafawati Md Rabu 
 
We select Mr. Kenneth Kong   (LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd). 
 
Please advice the liability before we arrange to survey. 
 
Thank you so much. 
 
Best Regards, 
Kenneth Ding 
HP: 92313123 
 

From: Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>  

Sent: Saturday, 26 March 2022 11:40 AM 

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 

Cc: 'SA 0406' <sa0406@dingauto.sg>; 'Accounts ( Ding Auto )' <accounts@dingauto.sg> 

Subject: TP CLAIM: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGU9128M AND SKZ9449M DOA 24/03/2022: CHECK LIABILITY 

 

Dear Auto and General Motor Insurance Claims Officer in Charge, 

 

Good day to you. 

 

Kindly refer to attached GIA report, TP insured, Certificate of Insurance, LOA and repair 

estimate for your further viewing and seek your approval. 

 

Please refer to attached video as well as proof on how the accident happen. 

 

We would like to check the liability for this case and look forward to hear from you soon. 

 

Once liability is clear, we will arrange for survey and repair. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Best Regards, 

Kenneth Ding 

HP: 92313123 
 


