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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 26 May 2022 11:04 AM

To: Francis Cher   TCBC

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: GY9500A ADJUSTED FINAL BILL

Hi Francis, 

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of P/P $13,251.50 /- with 

09 days of repair, subject to their approval 

 

 

 

 
Best Regards,  

Rasul | Assessor  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315  
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From: Francis Cher TCBC <francis.cher@borneomotors.com.sg> 

Sent: Thursday, 26 May 2022 10:47 am 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: GY9500A ADJUSTED FINAL BILL  

  

Hi. Rasul 

 

Attached the above vehicle adjusted final bill for you to finalize. 

 

 

Regards 

Francis Cher 

 

-----Original Message----- 

From: b050589 <francis.cher@borneomotors.com.sg>  

Sent: Thursday, 26 May 2022 10:46 am 

To: Francis Cher TCBC <francis.cher@borneomotors.com.sg> 

Subject: Scan Data from FX-2F43FF 

 

 

 

Sent by: [francis.cher@borneomotors.com.sg] 

Number of Images: 2 

Attachment File Type: PDF 
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Device Name: ApeosPort-VI C3371 

Device Location:  


