Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 3 June 2022 4:27 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto); Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Accident Involving Vehicle SND5439Z and SLF3334T (AIG) ON 25/03/2022 ok
LKK REF: CC6/A1G22002805/ga3

Attachments: 5439repair bill.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Hi Cecilia,

We refer to the above matter.

We submit our claim as follow :

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) S 2461.00
2. Loss of used (5days x $100) S 500.00
Total: $ 2961.00

Please let us have your offer to settle.

Thank you & Best Regards,
Jouis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195.

Tel : (65) 62898126
Fax : (65) 62870590
Email : jouis@jinauto.com.sg

From: jouis [mailto:jouis@jinauto.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 11 May 2022 10:35 AM

To: 'Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)' <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>; 'Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)'
<Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident Involving Vehicle SND5439Z and SLF3334T (AIG) ON 25/03/2022 *** LKK REF:
CC6/A1G22002805/ga3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Hi Cecilia,

Ok we will settle the case on 50/50



LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

To: Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Dear Sir
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SND5439Z AND SLF3334T ON 25/3/2022

I/We,the owner of Vehicle Registration Number. SND5439Z hereby authorise you to repair
my/our vehicle repair, submit ,correspond ,negotiate and settle my/our claim for cost of repair
and/or uninsured losses arising from the above accident .

I/We further confirm that the acceptance by M/s Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd of the settlement
amount in respect of such claim shall constitute the full discharge of my/our claim in respect
of such loss and damage.

Signed by :

Name: Lee Kwei Jang
NRIC NO: S8157497I
Date: 5 Sept 2022


Lee Kwei Jang
Lee Kwei Jang

Lee Kwei Jang
5 Sept 2022

Lee Kwei Jang
S8157497I


RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“We/l, JIN AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop”) hereby confirm that we/l have reached
an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for
S$1.380.00 (Global Sum) for vehicle no. SND 54397 that was damaged pursuant to the accident
which occurred on 25/03/2022 (date) along 279 BISHAN STREET 24, OPEN SPACE
CARPARK involving vehicle no/s SLF 3334T .

This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 04/04/2022 (date) at “the workshop”.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner LEE KWEI JANG (“the third party
claimant”) of vehicle no. SND 54397 make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l
have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/I deem fit. We/I enclose
herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”.

We/l further confirm that we/I will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party
claimant” after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and
expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the
damage to SND 5439Z (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this __ 5 (day) of __SEPT (month) 20 22 (year)
\_\(\K }\OEERV/CQP

Signed by appointed surveyor Signed %y “the WM” (with chop)



JIN Auto SErvices PTe LTp

Blk 14 #01- 410/412 Defu Lane 10 Singapore 539195

. : ’
JI nA Uto Tel: 6289 8126 (24 hrs) Fax: 6287 0590

Email: jin@jinauto.com.sg
Company Reg, No: 200704370C GST Reg. No: 200704370C
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TAX INVOICE

Invoice No: 1 8 8 4 6
Vehicle No:gl\j D G432 T :LL

Date: l/.@/ 20 )

Quantity DESCRIPTION Amount
Dk of Rtudod: 3530
‘\M/\W(: Sum Te—(\}w § 2500|-
N.B No responsibility will be accepted for any loss or E & O.E. ADD GST % Z (:’( T o

damage to any Vehicles or parts left in this workshop

for any reason whatsoever.

JiN Auto SERVICES P'\t"aJ Lt

TOTAL || D4 L+ o




Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 8 April 2022 1:19 pm

To: STEVENLEE1731@GMAIL.COM

Subject: <STANDARD LETTER> OUR REF: CC6/A1G22002805/Uga3 *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING

SLF 3334T & SND 54397 ON 25/03/2022 ***

Our Ref: CC6/AIG22002805/Uga3

08 APRIL 2022

LEE WAI KIEN

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF 3334T & SND 5439Z ON 25/03/2022

We refer to the above accident. We are the Appointed Surveyor and Loss Adjuster Company by your
Motor Insurer (AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd) to resolve the claim against you and/or your
authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

This is to inform you that we received a Third Party Claim from SND 5439Z.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario and pursuant to the above said accident wherein you
and/or your authorized driver had amongst other information given us your version of how the accident
had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable
settlement with third party claimant. Unless proven otherwise.

If you have evidence/information to proof that we should not settle the third party claim, kindly let us have
them in writing within the next 3 days i.e. by 11/04/2022, after we shall proceed with negotiation with Third
Party claimant on the without prejudice basis and any settlement should not bind any claims
whatsoever by you/your driver against the other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for
commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD
protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

c.c. AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence
should be made via email. Submission of claim related documents will be
in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,



Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6749-4274 | MAIN: 6256 3561 | EMAIL: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| FAX: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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Print Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SND5439Z (6889289001SG)
[SLF3334T]
TP

LEE KWEI JANG
Mar 25 2022 3:30PM
[LEE WAI KIEN]

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) (AIG_SG_EXPRESS), sent on 15/08/2022 15:53 PM.
To LKK_HQ
Subject Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$1380.50) - SND5439Z - Claim Handler: Goh, Jeremy-CX

Approved:1380.50:mandate approved. 3 days LOU. settle at best.




