Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 3 June 2022 4:27 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto); Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Accident Involving Vehicle SND5439Z and SLF3334T (AIG) ON 25/03/2022 ok
LKK REF: CC6/A1G22002805/ga3

Attachments: 5439repair bill.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Hi Cecilia,

We refer to the above matter.

We submit our claim as follow :

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) S 2461.00
2. Loss of used (5days x $100) S 500.00
Total: $ 2961.00

Please let us have your offer to settle.

Thank you & Best Regards,
Jouis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195.

Tel : (65) 62898126
Fax : (65) 62870590
Email : jouis@jinauto.com.sg

From: jouis [mailto:jouis@jinauto.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 11 May 2022 10:35 AM

To: 'Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)' <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>; 'Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)'
<Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident Involving Vehicle SND5439Z and SLF3334T (AIG) ON 25/03/2022 *** LKK REF:
CC6/A1G22002805/ga3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Hi Cecilia,

Ok we will settle the case on 50/50



