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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Lauro Araos Songcuan JR <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 25 May 2022 3:52 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Andre Chow En De; Coco Lu Ting; Loi Ai Ting; Kevin Leong Wai Kit
Subject: LKK Ref: CC4/AIG22002720/Epa3 (SLN3122X)     Our Ref: SJX2146E     DOA: 

07/03/2022
Attachments: SJX2146E - Letter of Demand.pdf

Dear Ms. Chew, 
 
Pls. refer to attached LOD. 
 
Our customer, SYED SUFRI BIN SYED HARON insured with DIRECT ASIA claims as follows. 
 
Cost of repair                     $ 7,799.87 
Loss of rental                     $ 2,739.20   ($171.20 x 16 days) 
                                              -------------- 
Total                                   $ 10,539.07 
 
Appreciate if you could quantify your offer of settlement the soonest. 
 
Thank you so much. 
 
 
Best regards, 
 
Larry Songcuan 
Customer Service 
 
 

 
 
Cycle & Carriage Singapore •  209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339 
T: +65 6568 4658  •  F: +65 6565 1240 •  www.cyclecarriage.com.sg 
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From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: 27 April 2022 10:05 PM 
To: Lauro Araos Songcuan JR <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 
Cc: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu Ting <coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Loi Ai 
Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Kevin Leong Wai Kit <kevin.leong@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Hsiao Tong 
(LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: SJX2146E (KIA) - FINALIZE TP CLAIM (AIG) 
 

This email was sent from outside of your organisation  

Hi Larry, 
 
Finalize please proceed. 
 
 
Thanks. 
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Best Regards, 
Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Lauro Araos Songcuan JR <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 
Sent: Wednesday, 27 April 2022 2:49 pm 
To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu Ting <coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Loi Ai 
Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Kevin Leong Wai Kit <kevin.leong@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: SJX2146E (KIA) - FINALIZE TP CLAIM (AIG)  
  
Hi Steve, 
  
Pls. refer to attached, labour item 14 taken out. 
  
Kindly confirm re-finalized amount of $ 7,289.60 before Gst. 
  
Thanks 
  
  
Best regards, 
  
Larry Songcuan 
Customer Service 
  
  

 
  
Cycle & Carriage Singapore •  209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339 
T: +65 6568 4658  •  F: +65 6565 1240 •  www.cyclecarriage.com.sg 
  

 
  
  

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: 27 April 2022 01:24 PM 
To: Lauro Araos Songcuan JR <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 
Cc: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu Ting <coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Loi Ai 
Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Kevin Leong Wai Kit <kevin.leong@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 
Subject: Re: SJX2146E (KIA) - FINALIZE TP CLAIM (AIG) 
  

This email was sent from outside of your organisation  

Hi Larry, 
  
Kindly take out labour item 14. Not necessary. 
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Thanks. 
  
Best Regards, 
Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Lauro Araos Songcuan JR <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 
Sent: Wednesday, 27 April 2022 9:16 am 
To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu Ting <coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Loi Ai 
Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Kevin Leong Wai Kit <kevin.leong@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: SJX2146E (KIA) - FINALIZE TP CLAIM (AIG)  
  
Hi Steve, 
  
Pls. refer to amended finalization, labour item 5 already taken out. 
  
Kindly confirm re-finalized amount of $ 7,369.60 before Gst. 
  
Thank you so much. 
  
  
Best regards, 
  
Larry Songcuan 
Customer Service 
  
  

 
  
Cycle & Carriage Singapore •  209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339 
T: +65 6568 4658  •  F: +65 6565 1240 •  www.cyclecarriage.com.sg 
  

 
  
  

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: 26 April 2022 10:25 PM 
To: Lauro Araos Songcuan JR <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 
Cc: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu Ting <coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Loi Ai 
Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Kevin Leong Wai Kit <kevin.leong@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 
Subject: SJX2146E (KIA) - FINALIZE TP CLAIM (AIG) 
  

This email was sent from outside of your organisation  

Hi Larry, 
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Kindly take out the labour item 5. 
  
  
Thanks. 
  
Best Regards, 
Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Lauro Araos Songcuan JR <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 
Sent: Tuesday, 26 April 2022 11:10 am 
To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu Ting <coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Loi Ai 
Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Kevin Leong Wai Kit <kevin.leong@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 
Subject: SJX2146E (KIA) - FINALIZE TP CLAIM (AIG)  
  
Dear Steve, 
  
Pls. refer to attached files. 
  
Kindly confirm finalized amount of $ 7,489.60 before Gst. 
  
Thank you so much. 
  
  
Best regards, 
  
Larry Songcuan 
Customer Service 
  
  

 
  
Cycle & Carriage Singapore •  209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339 
T: +65 6568 4658  •  F: +65 6565 1240 •  www.cyclecarriage.com.sg 
  

 
  
  
  
DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or 
entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are 
notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you 
have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the original message. Any 
views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd 
and/or any of its related corporations.  
DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or 
entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are 
notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you 



6

have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the original message. Any 
views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd 
and/or any of its related corporations.  
DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or 
entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are 
notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you 
have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the original message. Any 
views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd 
and/or any of its related corporations.  
DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or 
entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are 
notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you 
have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the original message. Any 
views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd 
and/or any of its related corporations.  







 SYED SUFRI BIN
 SYED HARON 







TAX CREDIT NOTE

DATE

14/4/2022

CN. NO.

C 4265

CUSTOMER

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
78 SHENTON WAY
#07-16 SINGAPORE 079120
ATTN: CLAIMS DEPARTMENT
C/O FORMTEAM ADJUSTERS PTE LTD

VHA NO.

P 4265

INV. NO.

P 4265

GST REG. NO.: 200106276D

Total

GST @ 7%

DESCRIPTION VEH. NO. AMOUNT

BEING SPECIAL DISCOUNT ALLOWED FOR INVOICE P 4265 SMS 1192 T -240.00

-$256.80

-$16.80
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 24 March 2022 5:19 PM
To: Laura.Ong81@gmail.com
Subject: Claim Notification - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLN 3122X(AIG) /SJX 2146E/ OTHERS 

AT/ALONG AYE (TUAS) BEFORE NORMANTON PARK EXIT ON 07/03/2022

24 March 2022 
                                                                
LAURA ONG ME QI                                         [By Email Only] 
  
Dear Sir/Madam, 
  
You Ref: SLN3122X 
Our Ref: CC4/AIG22002720/Epa3 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLN 3122X(AIG) /SJX 2146E/ OTHERS AT/ALONG AYE (TUAS) BEFORE NORMANTON PARK 
EXIT ON 07/03/2022 
  
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor 
insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. to deal with the third-party claim against your policy. 
  
We have received a claim from SJX2146E against your insurance policy. 
                
Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other information 
given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to 
negotiate for an amicable settlement with third party claimant. 
 
In addition, we would like to request for a copy of video footage as stated in your accident report for our necessary 
action. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact 
us within 07 days from the date of this letter. 
  
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected upon next renewal due to this Third-Party 
claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will 
be protected. 
  
Thank you. 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 
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Claim Audit

 

 
AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

1
24 Mar
2022
16:30

Clm Dtl
Modified Claimant's Name: -> SYED SUFRI BIN SYED HARON. Claimant's ID: -> SXXXX055I. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

2
24 Mar
2022
16:30

Clm Veh
Model
Changed

(206473) KIA SORENTO 2.4 GDI HID S/R (A). [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

3
24 Mar
2022
16:30

Clm Created
Reg No: SJX2146E. Acct Date: 2022/03/07. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
(SG). TP Insurer: Direct Asia Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd (HQ). Workshop: Cycle & Carriage KIA Pte L
td (Pandan Gardens)

[A] HOW MEI
KWAN

4
24 Mar
2022
16:30

Clm Existing
Check
Notice

[A] HOW MEI
KWAN

5
24 Mar
2022
16:30

Adj Co
Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

6
24 Mar
2022
16:30

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2022/04/04 [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

7
24 Mar
2022
16:30

Adj
Mandate Set Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

8
24 Mar
2022
16:30

Clm Ins Co
Changed

[200005] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) -> [203630] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Ex
press)

[A] Merimen
Administrator

9
24 Mar
2022
16:31

Label Added (19):Fastlane. [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

10
24 Mar
2022
16:31

Adj
Adjuster
Assigned

[None] -> CHEN TSUE YEE [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

11
28 Mar
2022
14:33

Video
Downloaded Downloaded SLN3122X OI VIDEO [I] Lee,

Ming-Yao

12
28 Mar
2022
14:35

Video
Downloaded Downloaded SLN3122X OI VIDEO [I] Lee,

Ming-Yao

13
26 May
2022
07:51

Adj Rpt
Initiated

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

14
26 May
2022
07:51

Clm Dtl
Modified Claim Conclusion: -> 3.

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

15
26 May
2022
07:51

Clm Dtl
Modified JPJ Reg. Date: -> 2010/05/25.

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

16
26 May
2022
07:51

Clm Details
Notified

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

17
30 May
2022
12:32

Adj
Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:10196.67:Liability: 100%(B28)
*Quantum: (a)CORw/GST: $7,799.87 + (b)LORw/GST(14days
x $160.00): $2,396.80 = Total: $10,196.67
*9 recommendation repair days + 2Saturday + 2Sunday +
1PRS = 14days
*For your approval please.

[A] CHEW
HSIAO TONG

18
16 Jun
2022
19:32

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2022/04/04. Mandate Remarks: Hi, please do include the additional rental
occured from 11/3/2022 - 23/3/2022 - BKW Invoice. I have uploaded into Merimen.
Regarding the Rent
al from Chan's, please proceed to negotiate starting

[I] Lee,
Ming-Yao

19
16 Jun
2022
19:32

Adj
Mandate Set

Approved:11181.07:Hi, please do include the additional rental occured from 11/3/2022 - 23/3/2022 - B
KW Invoice. I have uploaded into Merimen.
Regarding the Rental from Chan's, please proceed to negoti
ate starting from 12 - 14 days, @$140/day
C

[I] Lee,
Ming-Yao

Date From       Date To       Audit Type None Go



ACTIVITY
[25/03/2022 08:28] CHEW HSIAO TONG:
Informed TP: Pay for right rear damages only
[25/03/2022 08:28] CHEW HSIAO TONG:
*OI video shows that TP had hit onto 1st car before OI collided onto TP. The impact did not cause TP to hit onto 1st car again. * OI Liable for TP
right rear damages only



Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

Bill Ref No Bill Date Bill Type Acc Type Acc Name Co Name
(Branch) Ref 1 Ref 2 Amount

2776698 25 Mar 2022
08:14:09 Video Upload Motor

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd.

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (SG)

SJX2146E CHEW HSIAO
TONG xx.xx

2778575 31 Mar 2022
08:55:18

TP Case
(Insurer)

Motor LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

AIG Asia
Pacific

SJX2146E SLN3122X 11.00

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setlogin=0&CFID=97651520&CFTOKEN=acb054bc943b5cb7-72229C66-BDFC-F08A-98FFA53EF08936D5&USID=3251&RID=8125270
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=0&CFID=97651520&CFTOKEN=acb054bc943b5cb7-72229C66-BDFC-F08A-98FFA53EF08936D5&USID=3251&RID=8125270
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=1&personal=1&CFID=97651520&CFTOKEN=acb054bc943b5cb7-72229C66-BDFC-F08A-98FFA53EF08936D5&USID=3251&RID=8125270
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_composemail&mode=0&CFID=97651520&CFTOKEN=acb054bc943b5cb7-72229C66-BDFC-F08A-98FFA53EF08936D5&USID=3251&RID=8125270&urlback=/claims/index.cfm%3Ffusebox%3DMTRadjuster%26fuseaction%3Ddsp_viewhistory%26caseid%3D1077625%26extid%3D382099%26
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/undefined
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsec&fuseaction=act_logout&CFID=97651520&CFTOKEN=acb054bc943b5cb7-72229C66-BDFC-F08A-98FFA53EF08936D5&USID=3251&RID=8125270
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Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (Express)

2796572 26 May 2022
07:51:49

OD/TP Case
(Adjuster) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

LKK Auto
Consultants
Pte Ltd (HQ)

SJX2146E SLN3122X 11.00







