Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 23 March, 2022 12:55 PM

To: ‘assignments'

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: FW: YN3261Z - OD Claim

Attachments: SKOL223N0004_23-03-2022_121447 .pdf

Lonpac External - General

Our Ref : TBA
Dear Meng Yan,
Please proceed to survey and revert.

The excess applicable is $2,000.00 ( SectionI)

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: mttan <mttan@kanfs.net>

Sent: Wednesday, 23 March 2022 12:40 pm

To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>

Subject: YN3261Z - OD Claim

Dear Sir/Mdm

The vehicle is badly damaged and its left 2 months to scrap

Kindly arrange for an OD Survey for vehicle YN3261Z at 61 Defu Lane 12 SE539147

Documents attached

Thank you

Mr Tan
KFS
67479560






