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RE: DV AND INVOICE, Re: FBP7162L AUTHORIZATION TO REPAIR

Sbk E <sbk5643e@yahoo.com>
Sun 15/5/2022 1:44 PM
To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Dear Denise,


Please submit to AIG and advise the estimated time to receive payment. Thanks.


Regards,


Kwan S. H.

Director

Bike Production Pte Ltd

On Wednesday, May 11, 2022, 10:05:04 AM GMT+8, Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> wrote:







Dear Sir,


Lump sum 1900, 3days.


If ok, email me the discharge voucher and tax invoice.






Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone:6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




From: Sbk E <sbk5643e@yahoo.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 11 May 2022 9:54 am

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: FBP7162L AUTHORIZATION TO REPAIR
 
Dear Denise,



Please kindly confirm finalize amount for the cost of repair. Thanks.



Regards,



Kwan S. H.

Director
Bike Production Pte Ltd




On Friday, April 8, 2022, 02:51:31 PM GMT+8, Sbk E <sbk5643e@yahoo.com> wrote:




Dear Denise,



Thanks for your fast reply. Thanks.
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Regards,



Kwan S. H.

Director

Bike Production Pte Ltd




On Friday, April 8, 2022, 01:47:51 PM GMT+8, Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> wrote:





Hi,


supplementary approved








Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone:6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




From: Sbk E <sbk5643e@yahoo.com>

Sent: Thursday, 7 April 2022 11:06 am

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: FBP7162L AUTHORIZATION TO REPAIR
 
Dear Denise,



Please help seek approval for supplementary items too. Thanks.



Regards,



Kwan S. H.

Director

Bike Production Pte Ltd




On Thursday, April 7, 2022, 10:02:19 AM GMT+8, Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
wrote:





Dear Sir,  

   
As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle FBP7162L(Excess
$300)
  
If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at
Tel: 6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.  
   
All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance
company before completion of the repair.  
   
*Our client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.  


Main Stand and Side Stand not consistent or require.
Resurvey photos for check & supplementary items & replacement parts
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Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone:6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




From: Sbk E <sbk5643e@yahoo.com>

Sent: Thursday, 7 April 2022 9:55 am

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FBP7162L AUTHORIZATION TO REPAIR
 
Dear Denise,



Please kindly advise if FBP7162L is authorised to repair? Thanks.



Regards,



Kwan S. H.

Director

Bike Production Pte Ltd
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