Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: sharon@sngahtee.com

Sent: Monday, 6 June 2022 2:53 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FINALISE GBG9278X / AFTER PAINT
Hi Steve

Confirm. Thanks.

Best Regards

Sharon Sng

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com

SNGAHTE

MOTOR & PANELSE

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 6 June 2022 1:47 pm

To: sharon@sngahtee.com

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: FINALISE GBG9278X / AFTER PAINT

Hi Sharon,

Kindly refer our finalize $9750 (L/S, before GST). 14 days.

Thanks.



Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: sharon@sngahtee.com <sharon@sngahtee.com>
Sent: Monday, 6 June 2022 11:05 am

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: FINALISE GBG9278X / AFTER PAINT

Hi Steve
Please check : snett items shld be $852.70 ( | think u forget to add in reverse sensor)
LS $9800 14 DAYS.

Please confirm. Thanks.

Best Regards

Sharon Sng

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com

SNGAHT

MOTOR & PAMEL'SE

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 3 June 2022 9:59 pm

To: sharon@sngahtee.com

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: FINALISE GBG9278X / AFTER PAINT

Hi Sharon,

Kindly refer our finalize is $9650 (L/S, before GST). 14 days.



Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ikkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: sharon@sngahtee.com <sharon@sngahtee.com>
Sent: Friday, 3 June 2022 1:51 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: FINALISE GBG9278X / AFTER PAINT

Hi Steve

Please check & confirm.
Thanks.

Best Regards

Sharon Sng

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com

SNGAHT

MOTOR & PAMELS




