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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Tan Lee Gek (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <LeeGek.Tan@strides.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 27 April 2022 5:07 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: LOD   Your Ref: TAX/03/22/2040 (SHB5925T)// LKK Ref: CC3/AIG22002639/Rpa3 

[ACCIDENT INVOLVING SDR3396X(AIG) AND SHB5925T ON 18/03/2022]
Attachments: SDR3396X Statement.pdf; SHB5925T - video.mp4; 03 22 2040 - document.pdf

Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
We quantify our claim as follows:-  

       
Cost of Repair $700.00           
Loss of Rental $401.50 ( 5.5 days x $73.00 ) 
Loss of Income $330.00 ( 5.5 days x $60.00 ) 
LTA Search Fee $7.00           
Total $1,438.50           

 
We enclose the following documents:  

1) Repair invoice  
2) Proof of rental rate 
3) GIA report  
4) Accident vehicle laid-up report 
5) Hirer’s letter of authorization  
6) LTA search 
 

Please acknowledge receipt within 14 days from the date hereof and let us have your offer soon. Thanks. 
 
Regards 
Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6556 3548) 
Claims Department 
STRIDES Automotive Services Pte Ltd  
 

 
 

From: Tan Lee Gek (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd)  
Sent: Tuesday, 29 March 2022 11:52 am 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Your Ref: TAX/03/22/2040 (SHB5925T)// LKK Ref: CC3/AIG22002639/Rpa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING 
SDR3396X(AIG) AND SHB5925T ON 18/03/2022] 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
We attach our video footage as requested. 
 
Please note that our driver is NOT parking his taxi but waiting for his passenger. Double yellow lines allow vehicles to 
pick up or drop passenger off. 
 
Regards 
Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6556 3548) 



2

Claims Department 
STRIDES Automotive Services Pte Ltd  
 

 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 29 March 2022 10:29 am 
To: Tan Lee Gek (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <LeeGek.Tan@strides.com.sg> 
Subject: Your Ref: TAX/03/22/2040 (SHB5925T)// LKK Ref: CC3/AIG22002639/Rpa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING 
SDR3396X(AIG) AND SHB5925T ON 18/03/2022] 
 
Your Ref: TAX/03/22/2040 (SHB5925T)                                                  Without Prejudice 
LKK Ref: CC3/AIG22002639/Rpa3 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SDR3396X(AIG) AND SHB5925T ON 18/03/2022 
 
We refer to the above matter.  
  
Attached is a copy of our insured accident report for your easy reference. 
 
We would like to request for a copy of video footage as stated in your client accident report for our necessary 
action. 
 
Appreciate an early reply. 
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 


