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Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Motor Claims <motorclaims@sg.gaig.com>

Sent: Friday, 18 March, 2022 5:32 PM

To: Kuru & Co; Admin-D (LKKAuto); SUR; assignments

Cc: Chew, Elizabeth

Subject: RE:GAIG Ref:CLMOMVC000004141-Our ref: L22.0203.cj //  ACCIDENT INVOLVING 

GBC 4452M AND YP 3522K ON 17/03/2022 AT/ALONG AIRPORT ROAD INTO 

AIRFREIGHT CENTER NOTIFICATION OF ACCIDENT AND PRE-REPAIR SURVEY

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Irene, 

 

Noted on your request, as our client has not reported the accident we will survey on a without prejudice basis. 

 

 

 

Aside to LKK, 

Please accept assignment for TP survey.  

Thank you. 

 

 

For all first claim notifications on Property & Casualty Claims (excluding Motor claims), please email to 
GeneralClaims@sg.gaig.com 

 

For work injury compensation act (WICA) claims,  please email to wicaclaims@sg.gaig.com 

 

For motor claims enquiries, please email to motorclaims@sg.gaig.com 

 

For all first claim notifications on Marine Claims, please email to marineclaims@sg.gaig.com 

 

Regards 

Shery Wong, Executive, Claims | F. +65 62353354 | shery.wong@sg.gaig.com 

 

Claims| 3 Temasek Avenue #16-01 Centennial Tower Singapore 039190  

 

 

Thank you for your trust in us. We're proud to continue to serve you during this unprecedented 

time. As COVID-19 continues to affect us all, we assure you that we remain committed to providing 

the high level of service you deserve. Read more. 
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From: Kuru & Co <kurulegal@yahoo.com.sg>  

Sent: 18 March 2022 5:30 PM 

To: Motor Claims <motorclaims@sg.gaig.com> 

Cc: Chew, Elizabeth <Elizabeth.Chew@sg.gaig.com> 

Subject: [External] GAIG Ref:CLMOMVC000004141-Our ref: L22.0203.cj // ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBC 4452M AND 

YP 3522K ON 17/03/2022 AT/ALONG AIRPORT ROAD INTO AIRFREIGHT CENTER NOTIFICATION OF ACCIDENT AND 

PRE-REPAIR SURVEY 

 

 

Dear Sirs  

Our client is agreeable to the following surveyor as the SJE: LKK Auto Consultants  

Please arrange for your surveyor to survey our client's vehicle at the following address: 

3B EXPRESS AUTO PTE LTD 

25 Kaki Bukit Rd 4 #06-77 Synergy @ KB 

Singapore 417800 

Tel: Desmond 90296417 

 

Please instruct your surveyor to conduct the pre-repair survey immediately and complete the pre-repair 

survey within 2 working days of his appointment. 

Kindly let us have the pre-repair and/or post repair survey report upon completion of the survey. 

As solicitors on record, our client shall look to you for payment of our legal costs plus disbursements should 

you reach a direct settlement with our client's repairer. 

 

Regards 

Irene 

Kuru & Co  

150 South Bridge Road 

#04-06 Fook Hai Building 

Singapore 058727 

Tel: 6532 2009  

Fax: 6532 2007 

 

CONFIDENTIALITY CAUTION: This message is intended for the addressee(s) only and may contain confidential 

information and/or may be subjected to legal privilege. If you have received in error,  please notify us immediately by return 

email, delete this message and you shall not disseminate, distribute or copy any information contained herein.   
 

 
On Friday, 18 March 2022, 04:38:44 pm SGT, Motor Claims <motorclaims@sg.gaig.com> wrote:  
 
 

Without Prejudice 

Dear Sirs, 

Our client has not reported accident.  

We append the following list of our panel surveyors:- 

1.       AJAX Adjusters & Surveyors Pte Ltd 
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2.       A-PAC Adjusters & Surveyors Pte. Ltd. 

3.       Priority Services 

4.       RT Appraisal Pte Ltd 

5.       LKK Auto Consultants  

Kindly let us know which SJE is selected and furnish the estimates for the survey to be carried out. 

For all first claim notifications on Property & Casualty Claims (excluding Motor claims), please email to 
GeneralClaims@sg.gaig.com 

  

For work injury compensation act (WICA) claims,  please email to wicaclaims@sg.gaig.com 

  

For motor claims enquiries, please email to motorclaims@sg.gaig.com 

  

For all first claim notifications on Marine Claims, please email to marineclaims@sg.gaig.com 

  

Regards 

Shery Wong, Executive, Claims | F. +65 62353354 | shery.wong@sg.gaig.com 

  

 

Claims| 3 Temasek Avenue #16-01 Centennial Tower Singapore 039190  

  

Thank you for your trust in us. We're proud to continue to serve you during this unprecedented time. As COVID-19 continues to affect us 
all, we assure you that we remain committed to providing the high level of service you deserve. Read more. 

  

  

From: Kuru & Co <kurulegal@yahoo.com.sg>  

Sent: 18 March 2022 4:31 PM 
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To: Motor Claims <motorclaims@sg.gaig.com>; General Claims <GeneralClaims@sg.gaig.com>; 
rachel.tan@sg.gaig.com; kelvyna.ngian@sg.gaig.com 

Subject: [External] 1GAIC Our ref: L22.0203.cj // ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBC 4452M AND YP 3522K ON 
17/03/2022 AT/ALONG AIRPORT ROAD INTO AIRFREIGHT CENTER NOTIFICATION OF ACCIDENT AND PRE-
REPAIR SURVEY 

  

  

Dear Sirs  

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBC 4452M AND YP 3522K ON 17/03/2022 

AT/ALONG AIRPORT ROAD INTO AIRFREIGHT CENTER 

NOTIFICATION OF ACCIDENT AND PRE-REPAIR SURVEY  

We act for 3B EXPRESS SERVICES PTE LTD, whose vehicle registration number GBC 4452M was damaged in 

the above accident. 

 A copy of the SAS report is enclosed.  

As as result of the accident, our client's vehicle has been damaged. Before our client proceed to repair the 

damaged vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice whether you 

would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of the vehicle. 

If we do not receive any reply from you within the stipulated timeline, our client shall proceed to repair 

the vehicle without further reference to you. 

Regards 

Irene 

Kuru & Co  

150 South Bridge Road 

#04-06 Fook Hai Building 

Singapore 058727 

Tel: 6532 2009  

Fax: 6532 2007 

  

CONFIDENTIALITY CAUTION: This message is intended for the addressee(s) only and may contain confidential information 

and/or may be subjected to legal privilege. If you have received in error,  please notify us immediately by return email, delete 

this message and you shall not disseminate, distribute or copy any information contained herein.   


