Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 1 June 2022 11:59 AM

To: alicechau@kanfs.net

Subject: RE: RE: SMN4355Y (TP) - LOD //LKK Ref: CC4/11122002550/Vpa3
Attachments: DV_SMN4355Y.pdf

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We confirm settlement at $3,127.48(all-in).

Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: alicechau <alicechau@kanfs.net>

Sent: Tuesday, 31 May 2022 3:33 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: RE: SMN4355Y (TP) - LOD //LKK Ref: CC4/11122002550/Vpa3

Dear Hsiao Tong,
Please refer to the attached rental bill for your kind attention.

Thank you.

Regards,
Alice
Kan Fook Sing Motor Workshop



Tel:6747 9560
Fax:6748 1006

---------- Original Message -----------

From:"Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)" <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

To:alicechau <alicechau@kanfs.net>

Sent:Thu, 26 May 2022 04:08:20 +0000

Subject:RE: RE: SMN4355Y (TP) - LOD //LKK Ref: CC4/11122002550/Vpa3

> Without Prejudice
>

> Hi,

>

> Kindly provide rental receipt.
>

> Thank you.

>

>

>

>

> “Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

>

> In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

>

>

>
> Best Regards,
> Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
> LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
> Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |
> HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)

>

>

>

> From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

> Sent: Thursday, 28 April 2022 4:52 PM

> To: alicechau <alicechau@kanfs.net>

> Subject: RE: RE: SMN4355Y (TP) - LOD //LKK Ref: CC4/11122002550/Vpa3
>

> Without Prejudice

>

> Dear Sirs/mdm,

>

> We acknowledge receipt of your email dated 26/04/2022.
>

> We will look into the matter and get back to you.




>

> Thank you.

>

>

>

> “Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

>

> In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

>

>
>
> Best Regards,
> Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
> LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
> Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |
> HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408933)
>
>

> From: alicechau <alicechau@kanfs.net>

> Sent: Tuesday, 26 April 2022 1:48 pm

> To: Thevan (LKK Auto) <Thevan@Ikkauto.com>
> Subject: Fw: RE: SMN4355Y (TP) - LOD

>

> Dear Sirs,

>

>

>

> We refer to the mentioned claim.

>

>

>

> Please refer to the attached LOD for your kind attention.
>

>

>

> Thank you.

>

V V. V V V

>
> Regards,

> Alice

> Kan Fook Sing Motor Workshop



> Tel:6747 9560
> Fax:6748 1006

> emememeee- Forwarded Message -----------

> From:"alicechau" <alicechau@kanfs.net>

> To:"Thevan (LKK Auto)" <Thevan@lkkauto.com>
> Sent:Fri, 22 Apr 2022 12:28:09 +0800

> Subject:RE: SMN4355Y (TP) - Finalization

>

> Dear Thevan,

>

> Please refer to the attached photos for your kind attention.
>

> Thank you.

>

> Regards,

> Alice

> Kan Fook Sing Motor Workshop

> Tel:6747 9560

> Fax:6748 1006

> emememeee- Original Message -----------

> From:"Thevan (LKK Auto)" <Thevan@Ikkauto.com>
> To:"alicechau@kanfs.net" <alicechau@kanfs.net>
> Sent:Wed, 20 Apr 2022 05:10:44 +0000

> Subject:RE: SMN4355Y (TP) - Finalization

>

> >

> >

>>

>> Dear Alice

> >

> > “Without Prejudice”

> >

>>\We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of P/P of $2415.92 /- with 4 days of repair,
subject to their approval.

> >

> > Possible to send over the dismantle parts and bfr paint photos again?
> > Sorry for the inconvience.

>>

> >

> >

> >

> >

> >

> >

> >

> > Best Regards,

> > Thevan | Assistant Automotive Assessor

> >




> > LKK Auto Consultants

>>

> > Phone: 6741 3061 | Email: thevan@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
> > Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)
>>

>>

>>

> > From: alicechau <alicechau@kanfs.net>

> > Sent: Saturday, 2 April 2022 4:40 pm

> > To: Thevan (LKK Auto) <Thevan@lkkauto.com>

> > Subject: SMIN4355Y (TP) - Finalization

>>

> > Dear Sir,

>>

> > With reference to the mentioned vehicle, please confirm and finalise.
>>

> > Thank you.

>>

> > Regards,

> > Alice

> > Kan Fook Sing Motor Workshop

>>Tel:6747 9560

> > Fax:6748 1006

> ememene End of Original Message -------

>

> emememe End of Forwarded Message -------
>

> Regards,

> Alice

> Kan Fook Sing Motor Workshop

> Tel:6747 9560

> Fax:6748 1006

------- End of Original Message -------



