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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 1 June 2022 11:38 am
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto); Admin A
Subject: RE: Arrange survey vehicle no : GBJ-3418-H Nissan NV350 (TP)(Lonpac) *** LKK REF: 

CC4/LPC22002521/Ega3 - Oref: 21/21/22/VC00/025563
Attachments: OI GIA.pdf

Lonpac External - Confidential 
 
Dear Mei Kwan  
 
TP Repairer has submitted their claim via lawyers. Appreciate if you can let us have your report so to 
conclude the matter.  
 
Thank you.  
 
Best Regards 
 
Kenny Lim  
Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

 
 
 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or 

corrupt practices. 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Sunday, 20 March 2022 10:00 pm 

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-

a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Arrange survey vehicle no : GBJ-3418-H Nissan NV350 (TP)(Lonpac) *** LKK REF: 

CC4/LPC22002521/Ega3 
 
Dear Gerald, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Enclosed for your perusal is:  
-              TP estimated cost of repair 
-              Preliminary advice 
-              Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition 
 


