4/11/22, 8:16 AM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: RE: SUPPLEMENTARY _ SMH6124R_DOA :17.03.2022

Angela Tan <angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg>
Sun 10/4/2022 4:01 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>;Leong Chee Kwong <cheekwong.leong@munichautocare.com.sg>

Dear Denise,
We confirmed and acceptance $11k (10 days)
Thank you.

Regards
Angela Tan

Get Outlook for Android

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Sunday, April 10, 2022 9:04:30 AM

To: Leong Chee Kwong <cheekwong.leong@munichautocare.com.sg>
Cc: Angela Tan <angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg>

Subject: Re: RE: SUPPLEMENTARY _ SMH6124R_DOA : 17.03.2022

Dear Mr leong,
Please acknowledge.

Lump sum $11,000/- 10days.
(subject to insurance approval)

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 8 April 2022 4:44 pm

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: RE: SUPPLEMENTARY _ SMH6124R_DOA : 17.03.2022

https://outlook.office.com/mail/inbox/id/AAQKAGNIMTQ10DBhLTcONjYINGE3OCOSNWVKLTMyZWUwWMGFhNWIXNAAQAMXbxICgYkCloG94TUWNS...
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From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 8 April 2022 8:42 am

To: Leong Chee Kwong <cheekwong.leong@munichautocare.com.sg>
Subject: Re: RE: SUPPLEMENTARY _ SMH6124R_DOA : 17.03.2022

Attach finalised for SMH 6124R, please check and confirm. Final amount subject to insurance approval
thanks.

From: Leong Chee Kwong <cheekwong.leong@munichautocare.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 7 April 2022 9:15 am

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Angela Tan <angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg>

Subject: RE: RE: SUPPLEMENTARY _ SMH6124R_DOA : 17.03.2022

Dear Kenneth,
As for request n kindly refer to the photos attached

thanks

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 7 April 2022 8:41 AM

To: Leong Chee Kwong <cheekwong.leong@munichautocare.com.sg>
Subject: RE: RE: SUPPLEMENTARY _ SMH6124R_DOA : 17.03.2022

Awaiting for your after paint photos??

From: Leong Chee Kwong <cheekwong.leong@munichautocare.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 6 April 2022 5:22 pm

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Angela Tan <angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg>

Subject: RE: RE: SUPPLEMENTARY _ SMH6124R_DOA : 17.03.2022

Dear Kenneth,

Still pending for finalization request , may | know how much is the claims for labour your give

Thanks,Regards
Chee Kwong

From: Leong Chee Kwong

Sent: Thursday, 31 March 2022 4:00 PM

To: 'kennethkong@lkkauto.com' <kennethkong@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Angela Tan <angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg>

Subject: RE: RE: SUPPLEMENTARY _ SMH6124R_DOA : 17.03.2022

Dear Kenneth,

Finalization request_ SMH6124R _ TP CLAIMS _ LUMP SUM REPAIR _ DOA : 17.03.2022
https://outlook.office.com/mail/inbox/id/AAQKAGNIMTQ10DBhLTcONjYINGE3OCO5NWVKLTMyZWUwMGFhNWIXNAAQAMXbxICgYkClIoG94TUWNS...  2/3
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Please kindly refer to the attached the after paint photos for your reference

Thank you

Regards
Chee Kwong

From: Leong Chee Kwong

Sent: Thursday, 24 March 2022 3:45 PM

To: kennethkong@lkkauto.com

Cc: Angela Tan <angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg>
Subject: RE: SUPPLEMENTARY _ SMH6124R_DOA : 17.03.2022

Dear Kenneth,

RE: SUPPLEMENTARY _ SMH6124R_DOA :17.03.2022

Please kindly file attached supplementary & question mark photos and getting approved

Thank you

Regards

Chee Kwong

Motor Claims Advisor (B&P Dep)

Email : cheekwong.leong@munichautocare.com.sg

Phone: +65 96446630

60, Jalan Lam Huat #07-43, Carros Centre, Singapore 737869
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