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 Xin Hua Workshop Pte Ltd

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 

#04-01 (South Wing) 

Singapore  415933

xinhuaworkshop@gmail.com

GST Registration No. : 201838521G

Tax Invoice

BILL TO

China Taiping Insurance (S) Pte Ltd 

3 Anson Road #16-00 

Springleaf Tower 

079909

INVOICE XHW-INV-230032

DATE 31/12/2022

TERMS Net 30

DUE DATE 30/01/2023

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT

SMZ 5793 X - Honda Vezel 

Date of Accident: 15/3/2022 

Lump Sum Repair for Third Party Claim

4,400.00

All cheque payments should be crossed and made payable to "XIN HUA 

WORKSHOP PTE LTD" 

Please indicate the invoice no. on the reverse side

SUBTOTAL 4,400.00

GST TOTAL 308.00

TOTAL 4,708.00

BALANCE DUE S$4,708.00

GST SUMMARY

RATE GST NET

GST @ 7% 308.00 4,400.00

Transfer the amount to the business account below.











1

Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Sent: Tuesday, 14 June 2022 2:59 pm
To: chongleng.yee@chuanlim.com
Subject: <STANDARD LETTER> ACCIDENT INVOLVING XE 4299T & SMZ 5793X ON 15/03/2022

Importance: High

Our Ref:  CC6/CTI22002505/Aga3            
 
14 JUNE 2022 
 
CHUAN LIM CONSTRUCTION PTE LTD 
DRIVER: LEE KIANG NGUAN 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING XE 4299T & SMZ 5793X ON 15/03/2022 
 
We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 
to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken 
up with them. 
             
Kindly note that we have reviewed this matter and would like to advise that you and/or your authorized 
driver may not be absolved from blame for this accident. 
 
If you have evidence/information(EG: ACCIDENT VIDEO FOOTAGE / TRAFFIC POLICE 
INVESTIGATION RESULT/ COUNTER CLAIM STATUS AGAINST THIRD PARTY) to prove that we 
should not settle the third party claim, kindly let us have them in writing within the next 5 days i.e. by 
19/06/2022, after we shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant on the without prejudice 
basis and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by you/your driver against the other 
party’s insurer arising from this particular accident. 
 
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 
c.c.      China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd      
            (Motor Claims Dept) 
 
 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence 

should be made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be 

in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
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DID: 6749-4274 | MAIN: 6256 3561 | EMAIL: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| FAX: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 
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EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: Adeline Chng <adeline.chng@sg.cntaiping.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 23 November 2022 9:20 AM
To: EzLyna (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: [SEEK MANDATE] / SNM22D201812/C02/XE4299T/CHNGPW / FW: Direct 

Settlement - Accident Involving XE4299T (OI : CTI - TBA) AND SMZ5793X (TP : LKK REF - 
CC6/CTI22002505/Aga3) on 15/03/2022

[Strictly Confidential] 

 
 
 
 
Dear Ezlyna 
 
Please proceed to resolve claim at $ 5,795.45. 
 
Please request final repair bill from claimant and try to avoid settle in global sum. 
 
 
 
NOTICE : 
In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay 
is to be expected for handling hardcopy documents.  All correspondence should be made via email 
claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175.  . Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
 
Thank you. 
 
Adeline Chng 
Claims Department  
  
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909   
DID: (65) 6389 6155   |   F: (65) 6224 7175     
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG  
 
 
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any 
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify 
the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter. 
 
 
 
 
 

From: EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, November 23, 2022 8:19 AM 
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To: Adeline Chng <adeline.chng@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: [SEEK MANDATE] / SNM22D201812/C02/XE4299T/CHNGPW / FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving 
XE4299T (OI : CTI - TBA) AND SMZ5793X (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI22002505/Aga3) on 15/03/2022 
 

[Strictly Confidential] 

 

 

[Strictly Confidential] 

 
Dear Adeline, 
 
We refer to your email below.   
 
Accident date was on 15.03.2022 and date of inspection on 16.03.2022, surveyor recommended 6 working days (1 
Sunday involved).  Vehicle should be completed repair on 23.03.2022.  That was my calculation. 
 
Thank you. 
 
With warmest regards, 
Ezlyna 
 

From: Adeline Chng <adeline.chng@sg.cntaiping.com>  
Sent: Monday, 21 November 2022 4:20 PM 
To: EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: [SEEK MANDATE] / SNM22D201812/C02/XE4299T/CHNGPW / FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving 
XE4299T (OI : CTI - TBA) AND SMZ5793X (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI22002505/Aga3) on 15/03/2022 
 

[Strictly Confidential] 

 
 
 
 
Hi Ezlyna 
 
May we know how did you derive LOR 9 days?  
 
2 days PRS? When did TP send in survey request? 
 
 
NOTICE : 
In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay 
is to be expected for handling hardcopy documents.  All correspondence should be made via email 
claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175.  . Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

 CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you 
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.  
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Thank you. 
 
Adeline Chng 
Claims Department  
  
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909   
DID: (65) 6389 6155   |   F: (65) 6224 7175     
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG  
 
 
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any 
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify 
the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter. 
 
 
 
 
 

From: EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, November 1, 2022 2:51 PM 
To: Adeline Chng <adeline.chng@sg.cntaiping.com>; Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE:[SEEK MANDATE] / SNM22D201812/C02/XE4299T/CHNGPW / FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving 
XE4299T (OI : CTI - TBA) AND SMZ5793X (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI22002505/Aga3) on 15/03/2022 
 

[Strictly Confidential] 

 

 

[Strictly Confidential] 

 
Your ref: SNM22D201812/C02/XE4299T/CHNGPW 
LKK ref : CC6/CTI22002505/Aga3 
 
Dear Adeline, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING XE4299T (CHINA TAIPING) AND SMZ5793X (TP) ON 15/03/2022 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
It is a encroach lane case based on TP video footage, OI encroached into TP’s lane .  We are of the view that liability is 
not in our driver’s favour. 
 
We seek your approval to offer repairer “XIN HUA WORKSHOP PTE LTD" at $5,795.45 (all-in). 
 
The summary is as follows: - 
 

 CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you 
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.  
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  Amount Claimed Amount Revised 
1. Cost of Repair  $ 20,408.24 $ 4,708.00 (inclusive GST) 
2. Loss of Rental (13 days x $150) $   1,950.00 $ 1,080.00 (9 days x $120) 
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $           7.45 $        7.45     
Total $ 22,365.69 $ 5,795.45 

 
 
Surveyor recommended 6 days for repair. 
 
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 
 
Kindly note that this inspection report dated 04/08/2022 is only for mandate purpose. 
 
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction. 
 
Best Regards, 

Ezlyna Eng | Case Handler   

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6841-6051 | email: Ezlyna@lkkauto.com |  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 
 

From: Adeline Chng <adeline.chng@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Sent: Friday, 18 March 2022 5:52 pm 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) 
<CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Subject: RE: SNM22D201812/C02/XE4299T/CHNGPW / FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving XE4299T (OI : CTI - 
TBA) AND SMZ5793X (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI22002505/Aga3) on 15/03/2022  
  

[Strictly Confidential] 

 
  
  
Dear Mei kwan/Cecilia 
  
Attached herewith OI SAS report for your perusal. 
  
  
NOTICE : 
In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay 
is to be expected for handling hardcopy documents.  All correspondence should be made via email 
claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175.  . Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
  
  
Thank you. 
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