Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 6 June 2022 9:26 AM
To: SUR; CS A Team
Subject: FW: SMJ 8540Z DOA: 04/03/22

From: daud mohamad <mddaudn731@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 6 June 2022 9:25:18 am (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SMJ 8540Z DOA: 04/03/22

Approved, please proceed. Thank you.

Regards
Daud

On Tue, May 31, 2022 at 12:34 PM Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote:
Hi Daud,

Refer to attachment

Audit checked parts prices high, necessary adjustment required.
We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of P/P $4,516.71 /- with 04 days of
repair, subject to their approval

Kindly acknowledge

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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