4/18/22, 9:48 AM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: SLZ1234G

Accord Claims(AV) <avclaims@mycarworkshop.com.sg>
Thu 14/4/2022 9:27 AM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>

Morning Denise,
Agree on the finalize amount.
Thank you.

Kind regards,

Celia Lai

Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd
Blk 1009 Bukit Merah Lane 3
#01-80

Singapore 159723

Mobile: (65) 9274 0999
Tel  :(65) 6271 7433
Fax :(65) 6274 5715

This email is confidential and privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not view, disseminate, use or copy this email. Kindly notify
the sender immediately, and delete this email from your system. Thank you.

On Thu, Apr 14, 2022 at 8:27 AM Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ikkauto.com> wrote:
Dear Ceclia,

Re-offer at max $10250/-, 6days

Please check and acknowledge
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Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 12 April 2022 5:43 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Accord Claims(AV) <avclaims@mycarworkshop.com.sg>
Subject: Re: SLZ1234G

Dear Ceclia,
Offer at lump sum $10,000/-, 6days.
Please note that lump sum figure is approved and offer by insurance officer.

Please check and knowledge.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 11 April 2022 8:08 pm
To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Accord Claims(AV) <avclaims@mycarworkshop.com.sg>
Subject: SLZ1234G
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Hi Denise,

I've checked the finalize. Kindly assist.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ikkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Accord Claims(AV) <avclaims@mycarworkshop.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 7 April 2022 11:58 am

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Photos After Repair SLZ1234G

Dear Steve,
Kindly refer to the photos after repair as attached.

Fyi, no check item for number 13 & 18. Item no.6 ,is missing.
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Thank you.

Kind regards,

Celia Lai

Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd
Blk 1009 Bukit Merah Lane 3
#01-80

Singapore 159723

Mobile: (65) 9274 0999
Tel  :(65) 6271 7433
Fax :(65) 6274 5715

This email is confidential and privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not view, disseminate, use or copy this email. Kindly
notify the sender immediately, and delete this email from your system. Thank you.
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