Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 14 April 2022 10:41 AM
To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: Fw: SMW 8095Z DOA : 11/03/22

case finalised

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

=] Save the Larth- Print only when necessary-

From: Convergence Automotive <operations@convergenceauto.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 14 April 2022 10:30 am

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SMW 8095Z DOA : 11/03/22

Dear Rasul,
We accept the offer cost of repair of L/S $2,400.00 /- with 04 days of repair,

Thank you !

Warmest Regards,
Kaelynn | Admin Executive

CONVERGENCE

AUTOMOTIVE

CONVERGENCE AUTOMOTIVE (PTE. LTD.)

Co. Reg. No. 201820703D

39 Woodlands Close, MEGA@Woodlands #01-24 Singapore 737856
Tel: (65) 6993 2080 | Email: operations@convergenceauto.com.sg

www.convergenceauto.com.sg

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: The information contained in this email (including any attachment) is intended only for
the attention of the addressee and may contain legally privileged and/or confidential information. Its unauthorised
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use, disclosure, storage or copying is not permitted. If you are not the intended recipient, please permanently delete
the original, destroy all copies and inform the sender by return email. Thank you. An e-mail reply to this address may
be subject to interception or monitoring for operational reasons or for lawful business practices. Convergence
Automotive Pte Ltd (Company Reg: 201820703D)

From: Convergence Automotive
Sent: Thursday, 14 April 2022 10:26 am

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: SMW 80957 DOA : 11/03/22

Dear Rasul,

We accept the offer cost of repair of L/S $2,400.00 /- with 04 days of repair,

Warmest Regards,
Kaelynn | Admin Executive

COMVYERGENCE
AUTOMOTIVE

CONVERGENCE AUTOMOTIVE (PTE. LTD.)

Co. Reg. No. 201820703D

39 Woodlands Close, MEGA@Woodlands #01-24 Singapore 737856
Tel: (65) 6993 2080 | Email: operations@convergenceauto.com.sg

www.convergenceauto.com.sg

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: The information contained in this email (including any attachment) is intended only for
the attention of the addressee and may contain legally privileged and/or confidential information. Its unauthorised
use, disclosure, storage or copying is not permitted. If you are not the intended recipient, please permanently delete
the original, destroy all copies and inform the sender by return email. Thank you. An e-mail reply to this address may
be subject to interception or monitoring for operational reasons or for lawful business practices. Convergence
Automotive Pte Ltd (Company Reg: 201820703D)

From: Convergence Automotive
Sent: Wednesday, 13 April 2022 1:07 pm

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: SMW 80957 DOA : 11/03/22

Dear Rasul,

We accept the cost of repair of L/S $2,400.00 /- with 04 days of repair,

Thank you



Warmest Regards,
Kaelynn | Admin Executive

COMVYERGENCE
AUTOMOTIVE

CONVERGENCE AUTOMOTIVE (PTE. LTD.)

Co. Reg. No. 201820703D

39 Woodlands Close, MEGA@Woodlands #01-24 Singapore 737856
Tel: (65) 6993 2080 | Email: operations@convergenceauto.com.sg

www.convergenceauto.com.sg

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: The information contained in this email (including any attachment) is intended only for
the attention of the addressee and may contain legally privileged and/or confidential information. Its unauthorised
use, disclosure, storage or copying is not permitted. If you are not the intended recipient, please permanently delete
the original, destroy all copies and inform the sender by return email. Thank you. An e-mail reply to this address may
be subject to interception or monitoring for operational reasons or for lawful business practices. Convergence
Automotive Pte Ltd (Company Reg: 201820703D)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 13 April 2022 10:21 am

To: operations@convergenceauto.com.sg
Subject: SMW 80957 DOA : 11/03/22

Hi Kaelynn,
Refer to attachment

Audit checked part prices high, necessary adjustment has to be made. take note list
price
discount for Volkswagen model is 10% not 5%.

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of L/S $2,400.00 /- with 04 days of
repair, subject to their approval

Kindly acknowledge






