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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Lim, Sharon (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <sharon.lim@allianz.sg>

Sent: Monday, 22 August 2022 3:06 PM

To: Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto)

Cc: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto); Celine Fong (LKKAuto); Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: PLS INVESTIGATE 2022 22004226/SL-SND6030L

Internal 

 

Dear Sherwin 

 

Please render the tax invoice. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Sharon Lim 
Claims & Performance Management Department 
 
Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C 
79 Robinson Road #09-01 Singapore 068897 
 

 

 
 

From: Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto) <SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, April 11, 2022 6:46 PM 

To: Lim, Sharon (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <sharon.lim@allianz.sg> 

Cc: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>; Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>; Veron Chen 

(LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: [EXT] PLS INVESTIGATE 2022 22004226/SL-SND6030L 

 

Hello Sharon 

 

Attached is the investigation report. Please have a look. 

 

Best Regards, 

Sherwin Beh | Technical Investigator 

LKK Auto Consultants 

Office: 6256 3561  | Email:  SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933) 

 


