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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 2 September 2022 10:09 AM
To: 'Hui Yang Motor'
Subject: RE: Your Ref: SNC7396E // LKK Ref: CC6/CTI22002437/pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING 

XE7086X(CHINA TAIPING) AND SNC7396E ON 07/03/2022]
Attachments: DV_SNC7396E.pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
Thank you for your acceptance. 
 
Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Hui Yang Motor <hui_yang_motor@hotmail.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 31 August 2022 11:24 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Your Ref: SNC7396E // LKK Ref: CC6/CTI22002437/pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING XE7086X(CHINA TAIPING) 
AND SNC7396E ON 07/03/2022] 
Importance: High 
 
Hi Hsiao Tong, 
 
We accept settlement at $1528.50 (all-in) 
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Warm regards, 

Bel 

Tel: 64515752 

 

 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Friday, August 26, 2022 5:18 PM 
To: Hui Yang Motor <hui_yang_motor@hotmail.com> 
Subject: RE: Your Ref: SNC7396E // LKK Ref: CC6/CTI22002437/pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING XE7086X(CHINA TAIPING) 
AND SNC7396E ON 07/03/2022]  
  
Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sirs/mdm, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
We are of the opinion that this is a case of conflicting versions. There is no concrete evidence(ie: Video footage) yet 
to support either party’s version. Enclosed herewith in this email is a copy of our insured's accident report for your 
perusal. 
  
Strictly without admission of liability whatever, but with a view towards a resolutions of your client’s claim in the 
above matter without resort to litigation, we are prepared to offer at $1,528.50(all-in) towards your client's claim. 
  
Please confirm acceptance. 
  
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
  
  
  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Monday, 18 July 2022 3:14 PM 
To: Hui Yang Motor <hui_yang_motor@hotmail.com> 
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Subject: RE: Your Ref: SNC7396E // LKK Ref: CC6/CTI22002437/pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING XE7086X(CHINA TAIPING) 
AND SNC7396E ON 07/03/2022] 
  
Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
We are seeking mandate/instruction from our principal. 
  
We will expedite the matter and get back to you. 
  
  
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
  
  
  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  

From: Hui Yang Motor <hui_yang_motor@hotmail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 14 July 2022 11:38 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Fw: Your Ref: SNC7396E // LKK Ref: CC6/CTI22002437/pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING XE7086X(CHINA 
TAIPING) AND SNC7396E ON 07/03/2022] 
Importance: High 
  
  
Hi Hsiao Tong,  
  
Any update? 
  
  

Thanks & Regards, 

Bel 

Tel: 64515752 
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From: Hui Yang Motor <hui_yang_motor@hotmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, June 1, 2022 11:33 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Fw: Your Ref: SNC7396E // LKK Ref: CC6/CTI22002437/pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING XE7086X(CHINA 
TAIPING) AND SNC7396E ON 07/03/2022]  
  
Hi Hsiao Tong,  
  
Any update? 
  
  

Thanks & Regards, 

Bel 

Tel: 64515752 

  

  

From: Hui Yang Motor <hui_yang_motor@hotmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, March 22, 2022 10:37 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Your Ref: SNC7396E // LKK Ref: CC6/CTI22002437/pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING XE7086X(CHINA TAIPING) 
AND SNC7396E ON 07/03/2022]  
  
Hi Hsiao Tong, 
  
Please refer to the attached accident scene photos and we dun have any video footage. 
  
Can forward us acopy of your Insured video (if any). 
  
  
  

Thanks & Regards, 

Bel 

Tel: 64515752 

  

  

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Monday, March 21, 2022 3:26 PM 
To: Hui Yang Motor <hui_yang_motor@hotmail.com> 
Subject: Your Ref: SNC7396E // LKK Ref: CC6/CTI22002437/pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING XE7086X(CHINA TAIPING) 
AND SNC7396E ON 07/03/2022]  
  
Your Ref: SNC7396E                                                         Without Prejudice 
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LKK Ref: CC6/CTI22002437/pa3 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING XE7086X(CHINA TAIPING) AND SNC7396E ON 07/03/2022 
  
We refer to the above matter.  
  
Please be informed that liability is unclear. Attached is a copy of our insured accident report for your easy reference. 
  
We would like to request for evidences (ie: video footage/ scene photos / PIR) for our necessary action. 
  
Appreciate an early reply. 
  
  
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
  
  
  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  


