
1

Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Teng Hua <tenghua.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 9 May 2023 5:43 PM

To: Finalization

Cc: Vivian Tan; Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SLK7213G DOA 08.03.2022 AND SLV2084L DOA 14.07.2022

HI , 

 

Thank your for your email. 

 

For  SLK7213G, we are agreeable to  $1060.00  (P/P, before GST), 3 days 

 

For SLV2084L, we are agreeable to  $800.00  (P/P, before GST). But we propose 3 days. 

 

Please revert 

 

 
Regards, 
Ng Teng Hua 
Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd 

 

Tel : 6513 7748  I  Fax : 6251 3161    
Add : 74 Kian Teck Road Singapore 628800  
 
Make Life a Beautiful Ride 

 

 

 

On Tue, May 9, 2023 at 4:54 PM Finalization <finalization@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Teng Hua/Vivian  

 
Kindly follow up. 

 

For SLK7213G - We will be advising our principal for the costs of repairs in $1060.00  (P/P, before GST), 3 days. 

Subject to their approval. 

  
 

For SLV2084L - We will be advising our principal for the costs of repairs in $800.00  (P/P, before GST), 2 days. 

Subject to their approval. 

  

  

 Please confirm. 

  

  

  

  

  
 

 

 

 

Thanks. 
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   

Best Regards, 

Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

 

 

From: Finalization <finalization@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Friday, April 14, 2023 7:46 PM 

To: Teng Hua <tenghua.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>; Vivian Tan <vivian.pegasusengrg@gmail.com> 

Cc:  

Subject: SLK7213G DOA 08.03.2022 AND SLV2084L DOA 14.07.2022  

  

Hi Teng Hua, 

 
For SLK7213G - We will be advising our principal for the costs of repairs in $1060.00  (P/P, before GST), 3 days. 

Subject to their approval. 

  
 

For SLV2084L - We will be advising our principal for the costs of repairs in $800.00  (P/P, before GST), 2 days. 

Subject to their approval. 

  

  

 Please confirm. 

  

  

  

  

  
Thanks. 

 

   

Best Regards, 

Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Teng Hua <tenghua.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>  

Sent: Friday, April 14, 2023 5:08 PM 

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Vivian Tan <vivian.pegasusengrg@gmail.com> 

Subject: SLK7213G DOA 08.03.2022 AND SLV2084L DOA 14.07.2022 

  

Hi Hui Yong,  

As spoken, as Steve did not upload the photos at your side, we enclose the photos for these 

2 cars. 

  

Estimates for SLV2084L also enclosed, pls return marked. 

  

Both cases not finalised yet. 

 

  
Regards, 
Ng Teng Hua 
Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd 

 

Tel : 6513 7748  I  Fax : 6251 3161    
Add : 74 Kian Teck Road Singapore 628800  
 
Make Life a Beautiful Ride 

 

  


