




BIS MOTORING PTE LTD / 07.06.2022







Tax Invoice
Inv No. : INV2206453

Date : 01 Jun 2022
Ref : LOSS OF RENTAL

FOR SMN2513X
Currency : SGD

Terms : 7 Days
Sales :AIS Automobile

Pte Ltd 2
Referral ID :AIS 2

RA No. : GV2201-068
Veh No. : SMN2513X

GEOFFREY FONG CHI WEI
BLK 501 PASIR RIS ST 52
#05-217
Singapore 510501
Tel: 82386063
 

No. Description Qty Unit Price GST
Amount

Tax
Type Amount

1 LOSS OF RENTAL FOR SMN2513X
DOA: 11/03/2022
PERIOD: 14/03/2022 - 20/03/2022

1.00 616.00 40.30 SR (7%) 616.00

Subtotal : S$ 575.70
GST : S$ 40.30

Total : S$ 616.00

Remarks: 
    
LOSS OF RENTAL FOR SMN2513X
DOA: 11/03/2022

NOTE:
1. PLEASE ISSUE THE ABOVE PAYMENT TO "BIS MOTORING PTE LTD"
2. NO RECEIPT WILL BE ISSUED
3. PLEASE QUOTE INVOICE NUMBER WHEN MAKING PAYMENT
4. INTEREST WILL BE CHARGED ON OVERDUE ACCOUNT

THIS IS A COMPUTER GENERATED DOCUMENT. NO SIGNATURE IS 
REQUIRED
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 31 May 2022 3:35 pm
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Cc: MT_Claim_SG
Subject: RE: THIRD PARTY CLAIM SMN2513X & YN1164J ACCIDENT ON 11.3.2022 *** LKK REF: 

CC4/LPC22002363/Kga3

Lonpac External - General 
 
Dear Cecilia, 
 
Please proceed as proposed. 
 
 
Best Regards 
 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 
 
 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Friday, 27 May 2022 2:44 pm 

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: THIRD PARTY CLAIM SMN2513X & YN1164J ACCIDENT ON 11.3.2022 *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC22002363/Kga3 
 

Lonpac Ref: 21/22/22/VC00/025538 

LKK Ref: CC4/LPC22002363/Kga3 

  

Dear Sirs/Madam, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

We have highlighted to your good office on 15/03/2022 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our 
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd. 
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This is a BOLA S15 collision. Liability is not in our driver’s favour. 

  

Summary to offer to third party repairer, “MUNICH AUTOCARE PTE LTD” is as follows: - 

  
  Claimed Amount Revised Amount 
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 20,912.37 $ 7,355.15 
2. Loss of Rental (7days x $88.00) $      616.00 $    616.00 (7days x $88.00) 
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $          2.00 $        2.00 

Total $ 21,530.37 $ 7,973.15 

  

**05days recommendation for repair + 1sunday + 1PRS = 7days. 

  

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and  

reference. 

 
Kindly note that this inspection report dated 23/05/2022 is only for mandate purpose. 

 

  

The above is for your approval. 
 
 
 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence 

should be made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be 

in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6749-4274 | MAIN: 6256 3561 | EMAIL: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| FAX: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 


