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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 5 June 2020 15:26
To: Foo Chit Yan (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses); Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A; Tan Wei Teck (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses); Karen Chan Siau 

Chin (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses)
Subject: RE: OUR REF: BUS/09/16/5001; YOUR REF: CC3/AIG16021536/K1YA3; ACCIDENT 

INVOLVING SMB1462D & SKM8733S ON 06.09.16 ALONG UPPER BUKIT TIMAH ROAD

From: Foo Chit Yan (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses) [mailto:FooChitYan@smrt.com.sg]  
Sent: Friday, 5 June 2020 2:04 PM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) 
Cc: Admin A; Tan Wei Teck (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses); Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Svcs/Claims & 
IA/Claims & IA/Buses) 
Subject: OUR REF: BUS/09/16/5001; YOUR REF: CC3/AIG16021536/K1YA3; ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMB1462D & 
SKM8733S ON 06.09.16 ALONG UPPER BUKIT TIMAH ROAD 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Mei Kwan, 
 
We refer to your email dated 01.06.20. 
 
We  do not have any video footage since the accident in 2016.  
 
The accident was caused due to the entire negligence of your insured coming out from minor road while our client was 
moving straight, thus BOLA S1 apply.  
 
Without any admission of liability, we are prepared to recover our client's losses $845.00 in full and final settlement as 
follow:  
 
Cost of Repair: $565.00 
Loss of Use: $275.00 ($275.00 x 1 day) 
LTA receipt: $5.00 
 
Total: $845.00 
 
Kindly let us hear from you soon 
 
 
Kind Regards, 
 
Jimmy Foo 
Claims and Insurance Agency 
Direct line +65 6556 3521| ChitYan@smrt.com.sg 
6 Ang Mo Kio Street 62 
Singapore 569140 
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Vasanthi Rengiyan (LKKAuto)

From: Vasanthi Rengiyan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 16 November, 2016 5:40 PM

To: EDWIN@SOHTONGHENG.COM.SG

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto); Jas Khine (LKKAuto); Vasanthi Rengiyan (LKKAuto)

Subject: YOUR REF : SKM 8733S _ ACCIDENT INVOLVING  SKM 8733S AND SMB 1462D ON 

06/09/2016

Our Ref: CC3/AIG16021536/K1ya3Our Ref: CC3/AIG16021536/K1ya3Our Ref: CC3/AIG16021536/K1ya3Our Ref: CC3/AIG16021536/K1ya3 

 

16 NOVEMBER 2016                         

                                       

SOH WEE JIEH EDWIN 

227 JURONG WEST ST 21 

#03-381 

SINGAPORE 600227 

 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING ACCIDENT INVOLVING ACCIDENT INVOLVING ACCIDENT INVOLVING     SKM 8733S AND SMB 1462D ON 06/09/2016SKM 8733S AND SMB 1462D ON 06/09/2016SKM 8733S AND SMB 1462D ON 06/09/2016SKM 8733S AND SMB 1462D ON 06/09/2016    

 

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the 

claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them. 

 

Kindly note that we have reviewed this matter and would like to advise that you and/or your authorized 

driver may not be absolved from blame for this accident. 

 

If you have evidence/information to prove that we should not settle the third party claim, kindly let us 

have them in writing within the next 10 days i.e. by 30/11/201630/11/201630/11/201630/11/2016, after we shall proceed with negotiation 

with Third Party claimant on the without prejudice basiswithout prejudice basiswithout prejudice basiswithout prejudice basis and any settlement should not bind any claims 

whatsoever by you/your driver against the other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident. 

 

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for 

commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a 

NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.  

 

Please call us if you have further queries. 

 
 

Best Regards, 

R.Vasanthi (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2132 | email:Vasanthi@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 




