Vasanthi Rengiyan (LKKAuto)

From: Vasanthi Rengiyan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 17 November, 2016 2:13 PM

To: Edwin Soh

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto); Jas Khine (LKKAuto); Vasanthi Rengiyan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: YOUR REF : SKM 8733S _ ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKM 8733S AND SMB 1462D

ON 06/09/2016

Dear Edwin,
We take note of your below email.
We will look further into the matter.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

R.Vasanthi (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email:Vasanthi@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Edwin Soh [mailto:edwin@sohtongheng.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 17 November, 2016 12:46 PM

To: Vasanthi Rengiyan (LKKAuto) <Vasanthi@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ilkkauto.com>; Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <jaskhine@lkkauto.com>; 'Edwin Soh'
<edwin@sohtongheng.com.sg>

Subject: RE: YOUR REF : SKM 8733S _ ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKM 8733S AND SMB 1462D ON 06/09/2016
Importance: High

Dear Ms Vasanthi,

As spoken over the phone, please liase with Mr Yik from C&C for the pictures and video that you’ll need to dispute
the case.

I’'ve clearly mentioned in the report and fully substantiated by the in-car recording that the impact was from the bus
(SMB 1462D) moving into the yellow box thus hitting my car, while my vehicle was stationary in the yellow box while
waiting for my turn to move off.

Please investigate thoroughly before you settle any third party claim. As a matter of fact, I'm claiming against the
bus SMB 1462D for this accident. Appreciate your assistance on this!

Regards,
Edwin

From: Vasanthi Rengiyan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Vasanthi@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, November 16, 2016 5:40 PM

To: EDWIN@SOHTONGHENG.COM.SG

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto); Jas Khine (LKKAuto); Vasanthi Rengiyan (LKKAuto)

Subject: YOUR REF : SKM 8733S _ ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKM 8733S AND SMB 1462D ON 06/09/2016

Our Ref: CC3/A1G16021536/K1ya3



16 NOVEMBER 2016

SOH WEE JIEH EDWIN
227 JURONG WEST ST 21
#03-381

SINGAPORE 600227

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKM 8733S AND SMB 1462D ON 06/09/2016

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Kindly note that we have reviewed this matter and would like to advise that you and/or your authorized
driver may not be absolved from blame for this accident.

If you have evidence/information to prove that we should not settle the third party claim, kindly let us
have them in writing within the next 10 daysi.e. by 30/11/2016, after we shall proceed with negotiation
with Third Party claimant on the without prejudice basis and any settlement should not bind any claims
whatsoever by you/your driver against the other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for
commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a
NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

R.Vasanthi (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email:Vasanthi@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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