




 
 
 
CLAIM NO : 21/22/22/VC00/025545 
DATE  : 08 JULY 2022 
     

   DISCHARGE VOUCHER  
 
 
I/We, OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC 
INSURANCE BHD and/or owner of GBF 3285U the sum of Singapore Dollar Five 
Hundred Fifteen and Cents Ten Only ($515.10) in full and final satisfaction, 
liquidation and discharge of all property losses competent to me/us upon the said M/s 
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD  in respect of all property losses sustained by me/us 
whether now or hereafter to become manifest, arising either directly or indirectly from 
an accident involving SGV 3288T and GBF 3285U on 11 March 2022  along 1 
Woodlands Height. 
 
I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (LONPAC INSURANCE 
BHD/ GOURMET TRENDZ PTE. LTD. AND/OR PEK QING WEI) against all 
claims and any claims whatsoever made by any person/persons on our behalf in 
respect of the said accident. 
 
I/We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to OPTIMA 
WERKZ PTE LTD.                                                                                                                                                                    
 
I/We hereby acknowledged that this payment is made on a without admission of 
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our 
insured’s recovery action.  
 
 
 
 
……………………………………..     
Signature of vehicle owner/Date 
 
 
 
…………………………………….. 
Name of vehicle owner /Date 
 
 
 
` 

Tay Jun Yi
Typewritten text
Ng Guat Hoon/12 July 2022

Tay Jun Yi
Typewritten text
12 July 2022
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 6 July 2022 10:13 am
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Cc: MT_Claim_SG
Subject: RE: PRI - SGV3288T CLAIMING AGAINST GBF3285U (LONPAC), DOA: 11/03/2022 *** 

LKK REF : CC4/LPC22002337/ga3

Lonpac External - General 
 
Dear Cecilia, 
 
Please proceed as proposed. 
 
 
Best Regards 
 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 
 
 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 6 July 2022 9:16 am 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: PRI - SGV3288T CLAIMING AGAINST GBF3285U (LONPAC), DOA: 11/03/2022 *** LKK REF : 
CC4/LPC22002337/ga3 
 

Lonpac Ref: 21/22/22/VC00/025545 

LKK Ref: CC4/LPC22002337/ga3 

  

Dear Sirs/Madam, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 
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We have highlighted to your good office on 16/03/2022 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our 
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd. 

  

This is a head-to-rear collision. Liability is not in our driver’s favour. 

  

Summary to offer to third party repairer, “OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD” is as follows: - 

  
  Claimed Amount Revised Amount 
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $   7,427.41 $    353.10 
2. Loss of Use (2days x $120.00) $      240.00 $    200.00 (2days x $100.00) 
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $          2.00 $        2.00 

Total $   7,669.41 $    555.10 

  

**01day recommendation for repair + 1PRS = 2days. 

  

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and  

reference. 

 
Kindly note that this inspection report dated 27/06/2022 is only for mandate purpose. 

 

  

The above is for your approval. 
 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6749-4274 | HP: 8891 1278 | EMAIL: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| FAX: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Friday, 18 March, 2022 2:07 PM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 




