Shagilah (LKK Auto)

From: Karen Ting (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 25 November 2022 9:12 AM

To: Genevieve Kua (ECICS, Claims)

Cc: Accounts (LKK Auto); Swee Peng (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: ECICS - Outstanding invoices - Inv AC2204828

HI Genevieve,

Noted and we will check at our end and amend accordingly as per your instruction, thank you

Best Regards,

Karen Ting | Accounts Dept.
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6741 2674 Ext.127 | email: KarenTing@lkkauto.com | fax: 6844-8805

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.

From: Genevieve Kua (ECICS, Claims) [mailto:Genevieve_Kua@ecics.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 24 November 2022 3:12 PM

To: Karen Ting (LKKAuto) <KarenTing@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Accounts (LKK Auto) <account@Ikkauto.com>; Swee Peng (LKKAuto) <ongsp@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: ECICS - Outstanding invoices - Inv AC2204828

Hi Karen,
| entered the wrong invoice no. by mistake for the Inv AC2204828 payment.

Please check end August or early September transactions with payment details as AC2204050.

Policy No. MPCZZPO0041T700 Dur Claim No. DMPCZZ00098H
Risk Ho. 1.1 Date of Loss 10/03/2022
Vehicle SLOELl3IsK

Class/Agent/Country MPC  RAOOD00Z2% 3D 356G

Insured's Name

HAZLIE BIN RAHMAN

Cause of Loss {(OIV) SLQELISK rear-ended (IFV)
GBEKT08K (alleged braked abruptly) along PIE towards Changi before Upp Serangoon
exit

Claimant 2/1 - TPED - GBE708K (Survey: LEEK)

Desc. of Loss 3
Inv RCZZ04050 GBETOSK DMPCZZ00098H.02 GE
M0Z - SURVEY / INVESTIGATION - DS - DIT: SURVEY FEE 5GD321.00
[Deemed Tax S5GD21.00 )

TOTAL SINGAPORE DOLLAR 3GD3Z1.00



Best regards
Genevieve Kua

Associate | Claims
L
EC|CS

DID (65) 6303 0308 Tel (65) 6337 4779
Email genevieve kua@ecics.com.sg Web www.ecics.com.sg
Address 10 Eunos Road 8, Singapore Post Centre, #09-04A, Singapore 408600

From: Karen Ting (LKKAuto) <KarenTing@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 23 November 2022 3:53 pm

To: ECICS Claims <claims@ecics.com.sg>

Cc: Accounts (LKK Auto) <account@lkkauto.com>; Swee Peng (LKKAuto) <ongsp@lkkauto.com>
Subject: ECICS - Outstanding invoices

Dear Genevieve,
Great to have chance to talk to you via phone today ©

As per our conversation, understand from your that AC2204828 (item 2) already paid since August 2022 and its still
shown as unpaid in our system hence we do appreciate if you could let us know the payment mode and payment
date and we will double check at our end.

As for AC2203447, understand Crystabelle is on leave and only will back to office somewhere next week, and do
appreciate if you could assist to pass a message to her and we will follow up with a call to her on next Monday,
thank you

SN InvDate DOA VehicleNo Insured Invoice No Reference
1 060622 240222  SMX B837Y AC2203447  CSIC$22001936/Kqy3e? MPC22Al
2 050822  10/03/22 GBK 708K SLOS135K AC2Z204828  CSICS$22002317Vvy3ez MPC22PI

Best Regards,

Karen Ting | Accounts Dept.
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6741 2674 Ext.127 | email: KarenTing@lkkauto.com | fax: 6844-8805

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.

This message may contain privileged and confidential information and is only intended for use by the addressee. No representation, warranty, guarantee or undertaking
expressed or implied is made by ECICS Limited; as to the fairness, accuracy or completeness of any information, projections or opinions contained in this message. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination either in whole or in part is prohibited. If you are not the addressee indicated in his message (or responsible for delivery of
the message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. In such case, you should destroy this message and kindly notify the sender by reply
email. Opinions contained herein are the personal opinions of the sender and do not necessarily represent the views of ECICS Limited.

This message may contain privileged and confidential information and is only intended for use by the addressee. No representation, warranty, guarantee or undertaking
expressed or implied is made by ECICS Limited; as to the fairness, accuracy or completeness of any information, projections or opinions contained in this message. Any

2



unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination either in whole or in part is prohibited. If you are not the addressee indicated in his message (or responsible for delivery of
the message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. In such case, you should destroy this message and kindly notify the sender by reply
email. Opinions contained herein are the personal opinions of the sender and do not necessarily represent the views of ECICS Limited.



