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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Serene Lim <serene@limyewboo.com>
Sent: Friday, 22 April 2022 9:44 am
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: <S2M03V4I>_[TP REF:SKU6228E]_Accident Involving <SMS7008D & SKU6228E 

>_along_<Blossom Residences Basement 1 Carpark>on <06-03-2022 
18.40>_PersonalAutoLine

Attachments: LTA receipt-20220308-153657.pdf; Final Bill.pdf; Letter of Authorisation.pdf

Hi Hsiao Tong 
 
We are quantifying the below 
 

Cost of repair   $2,450.00 
Loss of use ( 3 days x $60 per day) 180.00 
LTA search fee  7.45  
TOTAL   $2,637.45 

 
We attached herewith Final Bill, LTA search Receipt & Letter of Authorisation for your reference. 
 
Thank you & await your reply soonest. 
 
 
Serene LIM 
Lim Yew Boo Spray Paint Co 
Tel: +65 64545011 | Fax: +65 64593724 I Hp: +65 96852332 
E-mail: serene@limyewboo.com 
 
From: Serene Lim  
Sent: Wednesday, 23 March 2022 3:55 pm 
To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: <S2M03V4I>_[TP REF:SKU6228E]_Accident Involving <SMS7008D & SKU6228E >_along_<Blossom 
Residences Basement 1 Carpark>on <06-03-2022 18.40>_PersonalAutoLine 
 
Hi Hsiao Tong 
 
Re-send the scene picture. As the file was too big as such I be sending the video footage to your mobile. 
 
Serene LIM 
Lim Yew Boo Spray Paint Co 
Tel: +65 64545011 | Fax: +65 64593724 I Hp: +65 96852332 
E-mail: serene@limyewboo.com 
 
 


