Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 9 March 2022 4:58 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: Fw: Our ref Claim ref: C10014085/CD || Insured vehicle SKA5551H
Attachments: SKA 5551H Car tyre report.pdf; Technical Investigation Reconstruction Record

(Sherwin).xIsx

Hello Shiau Chan
Attached is the investigation report and it has been uploaded into VIEWS. Please have a look.

Best Regards,

Sherwin Beh | Technical Investigator

LKK Auto Consultants

Office: 6256 3561 | Email: SherwinBeh@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933)

From: Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto) <SherwinBeh@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 9 March 2022 4:56 pm

To: Charandeep Singh <charandeep.s@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Our ref Claim ref: C10014085/CD || Insured vehicle SKA5551H

Hello Charandeep
Attached is the investigation report. Please have a look.

Best Regards,

Sherwin Beh | Technical Investigator

LKK Auto Consultants

Office: 6256 3561 | Email: SherwinBeh@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933)

From: Charandeep Singh <charandeep.s@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 9 March 2022 2:51 pm

To: Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto) <SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our ref Claim ref: C10014085/CD || Insured vehicle SKA5551H

Hi Sherwin,
Could you provide us the preliminary findings as our insured is chasing us?

Regards,

Charan
Executive, Claims



T +65 6989 3694
F +65 6725 0853
E Charandeep.S@budgetdirect.com.sg

It pays to choose
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Customer Care +65 6989 3684
Claims +65 6989 3686
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01
Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapore

239924

budgetdirect.com.sg

autot?;general

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget
Direct Insurance.

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 9 March 2022 11:54 am

To: Charandeep Singh <charandeep.s@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>; Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto) <SherwinBeh@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our ref Claim ref: C10014085/CD || Insured vehicle SKA5551H

Dear Charan
Yes, vehicle was inspected yesterday afternoon.
Dear Sherwin

Please provide your preliminary findings asap ie whether condition of tyres comply with RTA and whether
condition of tyres contributed to driver losing control of vehicle.

Best Regards,

Bryan Ang

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Charandeep Singh <charandeep.s@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 9 March 2022 11:39 am

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; SUR




<sur@lkkauto.com>; Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto) <SherwinBeh@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Our ref Claim ref: C10014085/CD || Insured vehicle SKA5551H

Hi Bryan,

My | know if you have inspected our insured vehicle and if the tires marks are below the standard LTA
requirements?

Regards,

Charan
Executive, Claims

T +65 6989 3694
F +65 6725 0853
E Charandeep.S@budgetdirect.com.sg
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Customer Care +65 6989 3684
Claims +65 6989 3686
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01
Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapore

239924

budgetdirect.com.s

autoa?;general

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget
Direct Insurance.

From: Charandeep Singh

Sent: Tuesday, 8 March 2022 12:54 pm

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>; Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto) <SherwinBeh@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our ref Claim ref: C10014085/CD || Insured vehicle SKA5551H

Hi Bryan,

The password is SKA5551H

Regards,



Charan
Executive, Claims

T +65 6989 3694
F +65 6725 0853
E Charandeep.S@budgetdirect.com.sg
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Customer Care +65 6989 3684
Claims +65 6989 3686
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01
Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapore

239924

budgetdirect.com.sg

autot};general

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget
Direct Insurance.

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 8 March 2022 12:53 pm

To: Charandeep Singh <charandeep.s@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>; Derrick Quok <derrick.q@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Justin Wong
<justin.wong@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto) <SherwinBeh@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Our ref Claim ref: C10014085/CD || Insured vehicle SKA5551H

Hi Charan

We will inspect the insured vehicle later today.
Have not receive the PW for the GIA report.

Hi Sherwin

As spoken a moment ago, please do the needful.
Best Regards,

Bryan Ang

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




From: Charandeep Singh <charandeep.s@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 8 March 2022 12:17 pm

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@Ilkkauto.com>; Derrick Quok <derrick.g@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Justin Wong
<justin.wong@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Our ref Claim ref: C10014085/CD || Insured vehicle SKA5551H

Hi Bryan

Our insured is claiming under his own policy, but we have discovered that 3 pieces of tyres are not road worthy
condition.

We therefore appoint your company to do the necessary check on the road worthiness of tires and if it meets LTA
guidelines.

Vehicle is currently at:

Ah Lim Motor (AMK)

10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Pk 2A
#01-09 AMK AUTOPOINT
$568047

Please advise when is the earliest you can inspect the road worthiness of the tires and provide us your technical
report as we have halted all repairs to insured vehicle.
I will send you the password to open the encrypted accident report in a separate email.

Regards,

Charan
Executive, Claims

T +65 6989 3694
F +65 6725 0853
E Charandeep.S@budgetdirect.com.sg
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Singapore
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Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget
Direct Insurance.







